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SPIRIT1 COMMUNICATIONS GIVEN IN THE PRES­
ENCE OF SCORES OF WITNESSES AT 

LAKE PLEASANT CAMP-MEETING.

Through Alfred James, Medium.

M. Atilius Regulus.
' “I Salute You, Friends:—I was consul for 
the Roman Empire in the first Punic war. I am 
here to-day for a mission. That mission is to un­
veil what priests have attempted to palm upon 
humanity as. religion. All religions, in my day, 
were copied from the Egyptian Osiris, with this 
great light that shines above your head—the sun 
—as the central pivot; which Sun. has been cor­
rupted intojSon, and this because priests, finding 
that the masses would not worship nor adore any­
thing that was not covered by a veil of secrecy, 
resorted to gods born of virgins, as the fundamen­
tal principle in nearly all the religions now exist­
ing on this mortal plane, In my time there was a 
constant struggle between the learned politicians 
and wily priests for supremacy; and sorry am I 
to say that the priests almost always triumphed. 
There never would have been that decline in the 
Roman Empire, and its final absorption by the 
Catholic church to-da.y, if the Roman people had 
listened to the voice of its politicians and orators. 
The famous Grecian God, Prometheus, dying on 
the Scythian crags, was. acknowledged as tlie sa­
viour of man, when I lived on tbe mortal plane. 
A pure invention, the god which I have men­
tioned—a myth in that day, as much as Jesus 
Christ is a myth in this. I feel as a spirit an 
earnest desire to lift this religious bondage that is 
now binding the human race. No spirit, however 
exalted, has any saving power whatever, except 
as it can impress spirits and mortals to do right. 
Nothing-will pass as a voucher for happiness in 
the spirit life' except a clear conscience. If we 
trace things from cause to effect, it is well there 
was such a god as Apollo—whether myth or npt 
—otherwise there would be no necessity for my 
coming here to-day, as an effect of that kind ot
teaching. As a spirit I have never found, with 
.one exception, that uny of these so-called gods 
had a real existence. This one exc ' ’

so-called g 
option is Gau-

;.l 
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and their roving bands completed the devastation 
of the country. The Carthaginians in despair sent 
a herald to Regulus to solicit peace. But the Ro­
man general, whB was intoxicated with success, 
would only grant it on such intoleroble terms that 
the Carthaginians resolved to continue the war, 
and hold out to the last. In the, midst of their 
distress and alarm, succor came to them frohi an 
unexpected quarter. Among the Greek merce­
naries who had lately arrived at Carthage, was a 
Lacediemonian of the name of Xarithippus, who 
appears to have already acquired no small.milk 
tary reputation, though his name is not mentioned 
previously. He pointed out to the Carthaginians 
that their defeat was owing to the incompetency 
of their generals, and not to the superiority of the 
Roman arms, and he inspired such confidence in 
the people, that he was forthwith placed at the 
head of their troops. Relying on his 4000 cavalry 
and 100 elephants, Xanthippus boldly marched 
into the open country to meet the enemy, though 
his forces were yery inferior in number to the 
Romans. Regains was neither able nor willing to 
refuse the,battle thus offered; but it ended in his 
total overthrow. Thirty thousand of his men were 
slain; scarcely 2000 escaped to Clypie; and Regu­
lus himself was taken prisoner with five hundred 
more. This was in the year B. C. 255.

“Regulus remained uucaplivity for the next 
five years, till B. C. 250, when the Carthaginians, 
after their defeat by the proconsul Metellus, sent 
an embassy to Rome to solicit peace, or at least 
an exchange of prisoners. They allowed Regulas 
to accompany the embassadors, on the promise 
that he would return to Carthage if their'propo- 
sals were declined, thinking that he would per­
suade his countrymen to agree to an exchange of 
prisoners in order to obtain his own liberty. This 
embassy of Regulas is one of the most celebrated 
stories in Roman history. The orators and poets 
related how Regulus at first refused to enter the

tama Buddha. I have seen him as a spirit; but 
he is surrounded, in spirit life, by a sphere which 
I have no desire to enter—it is too monotonous 
for an old soldier. The kind of sphere that sur­
rounds Buddha is one of rest. Ho taught that 
here, and, therefore, reaps that result in spirit. I 
like progression.. I do not believe, so far as 1 have 
seen during twenty-one bundled years of. spirit 
life, there is any doctrine or teaching that would 
impress me, or lead me to give up my individu­
ality, for all the happiness of an eternal quiet. My 
name when here was M. Atilius Regulus 251 
years. B. C. •

[We take the fo*l'owing account of Regains from 
Smith’s Dictionary of Greek and Roman Biogra- 
phy.—Ed.] ,' 5 \

“M. Atilius Rego his; was consul for the first 
time in B. C. 2(17, with L. Julius Libo, conquered 
the Sallentini, took the town of Brundusiuin, and 
obtained in consequence the honor of a triumph. 
Eleven years afterward, B. C. 25(1, he was consul a 
second time with L. Manlius Vulso Longus, and 
was elected in the place of Q. Odicins, who had 
(lied soon after he came into office. This was the 
ninth year of the first Runic war. The Romans 
had resolved to make a strenuous effort to bring 
the contest to a conclusion, and had accordingly 
determined to invade Africa with a great force. 
The two consuls set sail with 33U ships, took the 
legions on board in Sicily, and then put out to sea 
from Ecnomus in order to cross over into Africa. 
The Carthaginian fleet, however, was waiting 
for them under the command of Hamilcar and 
Hanno at Heraclea Minoa, and immediately sailed 
out to meet them. In the battle which followed, 
the Romans were victorious; they lost only' 
twenty-four ships, while they destroyed thirty of 
the enemy’s vessels, and took sixty-four witli all 
their crews. The passage to Africa was now.clear; 
and the Carthaginian fleet hastened home to de­
fend the capital. The Romans, however, did not 
sail direct to Carthage, but landed their forces 
near the town of Clypea or Apis, which they toqk, 
and there established their headquarters. From 
thence they devastated the Carthaginian territory 
with fire and sWord, and collected an immense 
booty from the defenceless country. On the ap­
proach of winter, Manlius, one of the consuls, re­
turned to Rome with half of the army, by order 
of the Senate; while Rennins remained with the 
other half to prosecute tho war. He carried on 
operations with the utmost vigor, and was greatly 
assisted by the incompetency of the Carthaginian 
generals. The enemy had collected a considerable 
force, which they entrusted to three commanders, 
Hasdrubal, Bostar and Hamilcar ; but these 
generals avoided the plains, where their cavalry 
and elephants would have given them an advan­
tage. over the Roman army, and withdrew’ into 
the mountains. There they were attacked by 
Regulus, and utterly defeated with great loss; 
15,000 men are said to have been killed in battle, 
and 5000 men with eighteen elephants to have 
been taken. The Carthaginian troops retired 
within the walls of the city, and Regulus now 
overran the country without opposition. Numer­
ous towns fell into the power of the Romans, and 
among others Tunis, at the- distance of only 
twenty miles from the capital. To add to the 
distress of the Carthaginians, the-Numidians took 

, the opportunity of recovering their independence,

city as a slave’ of the Carthaginians; how after­
wards he would not give his opinion in the senate, 
as he had ceased by his captivity, to be a member 
of that illustrious body ; how, at length, When he 
was allowed by his countrymen to speak, he en­
deavored to dissuade the senate from assenting to 
a peace, or even to an exchange of prisoners, and 

hen he saw them wavering, from their desire ofw
redeeming him from captivity, how he told them 
that the.Carthaginians had given him a slow poi­
son, which would soon terminate his life; and 
how, finally, when tbe senate through his influ­
ence refused the oilers of the Carthaginians, he 
firmly resisted all the persuasions of his friends 
to remain at Rome, and returned to Carthage, 
where a martyr’s death awaited him. On his 
arrival at, Carthage, he is said lo have been put to 
death with the most excruciating torture. '■ *

■ “ Regulus was one of the favorite characters of 
early Roman history. Not only was he celebrated 
on account of his heroism in giving the senate 
advice which secured hinra martyr's death, but 
also on account of his frugality and simplicity of 
life. Jake Fabriciusj^ lived on his 
hereditary farm which ho cultivated with his own 
hands ; and subsequent ages loved to tell how he 
petitioned the senate for his recall from Africa, 
when he was in the full career of victory, as his 
farm was going to ruin in his absence, and liis 
family was suffering from want.”

[It was this beloved Roman niartyr whose spirit 
returned and.testified as set forth in liis commu­
nication through Alfred James. His testimony is 
only cumulative as to the fact that the Greek and 
Roman religions .were but copies of the Egyptian 
religion of Osiris, or the sun personified; and that 
the dogma of a belief in gods, the sons of virgins, 
was common to all religions in his day. It Would 
seem from the testimony of spirit Regulus, that 
the rivalry between tho priests and tehiporarru- 
lers of men to obtain supremacy, was as desperate 
two thousand years ago as it has been ever since 
—the priests managing always to triumph in the 
end. It is an undeniable fact that Prometheus, 
dying on the Scythian crag, was regarded by the 
Greeks and Romans, hundreds of years before tlie 
alleged birth and death of Jesus, as being as much 
a saviour of mankind, as the latter Christian 
myth is now by Christians, We are told by this 
unselfish Roman spirit, that-of the so-called 
gods that are claimed to have existed, he 
had seen but one as a spirit—and that one, Gau­
tama Buddha. His description of the spirit Sphere 
of that great and good spirit, is perfectly consist­
ent with the teachings of that renowned religious 
leader. The communication is perfectly eoiisist- 
ent with the historicaL facts regarding Regulus, 
•and I believe is perfectly authentic.—Ed.] '

Communists, but their followers were not allowed 
to become'such. At Alexandria, the most re­
nowned priests of the East and West, over the 
then civilized world, assembled to compare notes; 
and as has been before stated by a spirit who com­
municated through this medium, they;,formed 
that idea, which was afterwards putin operation 
by Constantinns Ppgonatus, of the body ofthe god 
(Prometheus) spoken of by the former spirit, to. 
which was attached the head of Apollonius of 
Tyana, but which the ancient Christians would 
not accept, but continued to worship the first sign 
of the Zodiac, Aries, the Lamb or Ram. The 
former idea did not find its proper place until the 
sixth century. . But the whole account of the de­
cision of the Gnostics, the Gymnosophists, and 
other sects, who met in council at Alexandria in 
A. D. 1G1, was written by me; and I hope that my 
writings, of which true copies, as they originally 
read, are now in the possession of the Maronite 
monks, of Mt. Lebanon; Syria, may, yet be forth­
coming. These once in the possession of moderns, 
nnd tho whole fabric of Christianity wilL be 
stamped as a forgery. I am quoted as a father of 
the Christian Church. I deny it. I was a father 
of .a socialistic community, of which celibacy was 
the principal tenet. My name was Clement Alex- 
andrinus.

[We take the following of Clemens from Mc­
Clintock and Strong's Cyclopedia of Ecclesiasti­
cal Literature.—Ed.] .

“Titus Flavius Clemens, surnamed Alexan­
drinus, was a native of either Athens or Alexan­
dria, and flourished in the reigns of Severus and 
Caracalla (the date of his birth being placed about 
A. D. l(!0, and that of his death from A. D. 215 to 
220 ). He was in early life an ardent student of 
literature and philosophy, especially of the Stoic 
and Platonic schools, and was led by his studies to 
Christianity. To master its history and doctrines 
he visited different countries, and received instruc- 
lions from various masters, * * *. . .

“ His last teacher was (according to Eusebius) 
Pantaenus, head of tho catechetical school at 
Alexandria, by whose influence some suppose 
Clemens, as yet only a sincere inquirer, was led 
fully to embrace the Christian faith. He is called 
a presbyter by early Christian writers, haying 
probably been appointed to that office by the 
Church at Alexandria, and about 190, according 
to some, the assistant, according to others the suc­
cessor to Pantaenus, when the latter set out on 
his missionary tour to tlie East, lie continued in 
that olliec until the persecution under Severus, 
A. D. 202; compelled him to leave Alexandria. 
Tlie writers in Smith’s Dictionary of Greek and 
Roman Biography and Mythology, and the New 
American Cyelopiedinstate that Clemens returned

Clement Alexandhinus.
I Gheet You:—I always taught .when seated. 

(The former spirit had spoken while the medium 
was standing up.) Too much’ religion has been a 
curse to me as a spirit. «Iknew of the writings of 
one Marcion—not that he was the author of them— 
but he substituted a myth for a reality. That 
reality wasApolloni'ns of Tyana. I received copies 
from him, and I followed his text as far as it suited 
me. But there was one great desire that animated 
me as a mortal. That was to establish a fraternity 
of monks; and in this I succeeded, but I did not 
dare to let them know the' light that I had re­
ceived ; so I used the name of Apollonius, which 
after my time was erased and the name of Jesus 
Christ substituted by Eusebius of Gesarea. All 
his translations of my writings are, in the main, 
forgeries. He took my communistic doctrines and 
used them to found a church. That is, the lead­
ers of the Roman Catholic Church were to be

planted mountain, where fruit and other trees are 
confusedly grouped together, so as to baffle the 
plunderer, while the careful husbandman would 
find and transplant in fitting order such as were 
desirable for fruit or ornament; so tn«.mysteries, 
of the Christian faith, veiled, herein flop imper­
tinent or ignorant curiosity, will discover there 
rich treasures to the honest and intelligent seeker; 
of the truth. The object of the wohki is -to fur­
nish materials for the construction of a true gnosis’ 
or ‘ Christian philosophy on the basis of faith,! for 
those who had been trained for it by the preced­
ing works. Book I, of which the beginning's 
lost, descants on the utility of philosophy as pre­
paring the heathen for the reception of .the Gos­
pel, and Christians for the defence of their faith, 
maintaining that the good in heathen .philosophy 
wasderived from the Hebrews. Book II treats

to Alexandria before 211, and then became- the 
master of the school as successor of Pantaenus; 
but the weight of authority favors the earlier 
date, and his return to that place is doubtful. We 
know scarcely anything of the closing years of 
his life, lie appears to have beelulboift 210 or 
211 in Jerusalem, for he is mentioned by Eusebius 
as the bearer oful letter from Alexander, bishop 
of Jerusalem, then himself a prisoner, for the 
gospel’s sake, to the Church at Antioch. ■ This 
Alexander and the more famous Origen ure reck­
oned among his pupils. v ■

“Of the early Christian writers, Clemens was 
the most learned in the history, philosophy, and 
science of the nations of his day, and the influ­
ence of his studies is .apparent in his writings, 
which display rather the speculative philosopher 
than the accurate theologian—more the’fanciful 
interpreter than tho careful expounder of the 
scriptures on true exegetical principles. Many of 
his works have been lost, but those extant are the 
largest belonging to that early period, and very 
valuable for the light they throw on the,.social 
condition of tiny Roman Empire in his day, and 
for the information they contain in regard to the 
systems of ancient philosophy, the heresies and 
schisms in the primitive Church, as well as for 
tlie numerous extracts from non-extant. uuthnrs. 
IBs three chief writings form a series, and were 
written apparently with a common object, viz.: to 
convert the heathen and educate them in the 
principles and practice of the Christian lifo. They, 
are: 1. Logon prolreptikon pron ’Ellcnan, Cohorlatio 
ad IMlmas (appeal to the Greeks), an ilpologetic 
work, in which the absurdity, obscenity, cruelty, 
impostures, and sordidness of heathen worship are 
so clearly set forth in contrast with tlie simplicity 
and purity of Christian faith and practice. 2. 
paidugogon (InHltwior) a treatise on Christian 
education, in three books, addressed to those who 
had been converted from heathenism. In Book I 
we have set fortli the function, tho means, meth­
ods, and ends of the‘Instructor,’who is Christ, 
leading the believers ‘through paths of virtue and 
truth’ to salvation, not through fear, as he did the 
Israelites, but by love, the guiding principle of 
tho new and better covenant. Book II contains 
rules for the regulation of life, behavior, etc., rec­
ommending temperance, purity, modesty, and 
frugality. Book III begins with an; examination 
ofthe grounds of<rui/beauty, showing it to be in­
tellectual, and founded on reason and lovo; then 
in considering the various modes in which men 
sought to add to beauty, strongly reprobates luxu­
rious dress and' living, etc. Its satire of the follies 
and vices of the times are caustic.aiid humorous. 
3, Stromntcin or Stromata, in eight books, of which 
the'eighth is lost, (the imperfect treatise on logic, 
standing at present as^such, belonging to some 
other work). The word Stromaldi, meaning patch­
work, is’significant of the miscellaneous character 
ofthe work, which is discursive and unmethodical, 
and not unaptly likened by its author to ‘a thickly

first of faith and repentance, combatting the errors 
ofthe Basilidians and Valentiniansj asserts the 
freedom of man’s will, and presents the views of 
different philosophers in regard to marriage, 
which Clemens defends upon the grounds of the 
natural conformation of the sexes, the, command 
of God (Gen, i, 28), and the natural^aldin sick­
ness and age rendered by husband, and wife, and 
parents and children. In Book III, continuing 
the same subject, he condemns the opinions of the 
Mareionites, Curpoerutians, and other heretics who 
opposed marriage for different and contradictory 
reasons, alleging in support of it the,words of St. 
Paul (I Tim. iv, 1-3) and the example of the 
Apostles Peter and Philip, who were married and 
had children. Book IV discourses .of Christian 
perfection as exemplified in the Christian martyr, 
who is led to martyrdom not through fear of pun­
ishment or hope of reward hereafter;but from 
love to Christ, and who does not needlessly pro­
voke his fate, but only accepts it cheerfpily when 
called upon in that'way as a witness for the truth. 
The chief aim of Book V is to prove that the 
Greeks derived most of their wisdom, front those 
called by them barbarians, and especially front 
Moses and the Hebrew prophets: but it also en- 
tors upon a long and interesting discussion on tiio 
origin and use of symbols, and makes many valu­
able statements in regard to the Egyptian hiero- 
plyphics and the dress and ceremonial services of 
the Hebrew priests. This episode U.one of the. 
most curious relies of antiquity, and the book 
abounds in quotations from ancient authors. Books 
VI and VII portray the true Gnostic, tho perfect 
Christian, who is presented ask‘complete model 
of moral conduct,’ not so much desirous of living 
as of living rightly, controlling his passions and 
regulating liis desires in conformity with the laws 
of Christ.”

[Says Dr. Lardner, after having referred to the 
three works of Clement above cited.—Ed. |

“ Beside these there is frequent mention in Eu­
sebius of another book of Clement, called Hypo- 
tuposes or Institutions, which is lost. * * * ■

“Photius indeed has'severely censured Clem­
ent's Ilypotuposes, or Institutions. I Wo have not. 
that work, to enable-us to judge of tho justness of 
his censure; but it seems, that in that work 
Clement collected mid delivered a variety of 
opinions of .the ancients, of heretics as well 

: as Catholics. This is probably the. reason of the 
blasphemies and fables, whicli Photius says there 
were ih that book. Tliis is an observation of R. 
Simon. Tlie more ancient writers, however, seem 
not to have taken any offence at it. who knew his 
work very well, and yet have; bestowed their 
praises on the author without, hesitation,”

[What has become of Clement’s' Institutions ? ’ 
and why are we allowed to know so little of its 
contents? Let the spirits of Eusebius and his 
abettors in his pious frauds, appear and answer, 
for upon them rests the heavy responsibility of 
the concealment or destruction of that important 
ancient book. It will be observed that there is 
no historical mention that Clement of Alexandria 
ever founded or attempted to found a fraternity 
of monks; but who can read the synopsis; given 
above, of his writings, and hot see that his labors 
were all in the direction of monachism, and an 
ascetic and self-denying life; and that so far from 
being what is now regarded as an orthodox Chris­
tian, he was what orthodox Christians now 
designate a heretical Gnostic. For a Christian 
writer to speak ofthe true Gnostic” as synony­
mous with “ the perfect Christian," as does the 
Christian writer I have quoted/ Is to resolve 
Christianity into Gnosticism. Whht then is 
Gnosticism? Says a writer in the American Cy- 
clopiedia: “ Gnostics; (Greek Gnonin, knowledge]) 
a name given- to^wripus heretical sects, in the  
early Christian churchX (A pretty Christian 
church was that, when heretical Gnostics were its 
exponents and dominant/rulers I) “We know 
them,” says this writer, " mainly through their 
opponents, almost nothing remaining of Gnostic 
writings, except the fragmentary quotations found 
in orthodox authors. Gnosticism was a natural 
result of the contact of Christianity with Oriental 
and Greek philosophy, and was the earliest at­
tempt to construct a philosophical system of faith. 
It undertook to answer the most difficult ques­
tions, such as that of the origin of evil, and soon 
became extravagant, and met the opposition of ' 
the leading Christian writers. ‘ Gnosticism was 
now generally condemned as heretical, tfnd, after 
having been most prosperous in the1 second cen­
tury, declined in the third, and in the sixth came, . 
with other heresies, under the ban of the Justinian 
code. It was a speculative system, and exercised

■ little influence upon the masses of tbe people. It 
■ was also1 mainly confined to the Eastern church, 
, and had little to do with the development of the 

West.” 8o much the worse for the West If
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Gnosticism had had everything to do with the 
development of the West, the human race would 
never nave been cursed with the religious incubus 
designated Christian theology. Knowledge, the 
essence as well as the synonym of Gnosticism, 
would have prevailed over the whole earth, 
instead of the ignorance, superstition, and selfish­
ness that are tne essential concomitants of the 
prevailing Christianity of the present day. Clem­
ent in his communication denies that he was a 
Christian, or that he had ought to do with found­
ing Christianity. As his writings show, so for as 
we have ariy trace of them, he,was a Gnostic, and 
undoubtedly one of those who had. been initiated 
in the secrets of the sacred mysteries of the most 
advanced knowledge of his day. Clement tells us 
that he knew, of the writings published to the 
world by Marcion* and that he received copies of 
them from Marcion himself. He says nothing 
whatever about either of the four canonical Gos­
pels, and we may therefore naturally infer that 
they had no existence at the time Marcion pub­
lished his Gospel And Epistles. He further tells 
us that Marcion concealed the real author and 
substituted a mythical person in his stead—that 
author being none other than Apollonius of 
Tyana. If that communication is authentic, and 
was given by the spirit of Clement, as I insist 
was the'tiase, then were the writings published by 
Marcion, only as late as the middle of the second 
centufy.the first documentary source from which'' 
all subsequent Christian writings were either di­
rectly or'indirectly, deri ved,andthe true and 
only 'foundation' ' or the theological fictions that 
have been raised upon them. It seems from the 
testimony of the spirit that he made use of the 
writings, copies of which were sent to him by 
Marcion, in carrying out his desire to establish a 
fraternity of monks, so far as they suited him and 
no further. He claims to have succeeded, but 
admits that he did not dare to let his monkish 
followers kbovrthe real nature of his teachings. 
He tells us that he used the name of Apollonius 
in his writings and teachings, and that Eusebius 
of Caesarea, subsequently erased it and substituted 
for it the name-of Jesus Christ. Clement claims 
that all the “translations,” doubtless meaning 
versions, of his writings, by Eusebius, are, in the 
main, forgeries; and charges the latter with hav­
ing used his “Communistic doctrines” to found the 
Christian Church. In the light of that spirit dis­
closure, who can be at a loss to understand why the 
Hypolupout or “Institutions” of Clement are lost? 
Eusebius having appropriated the Communistic 
policy and teachings of Clement, the Gnostic here­
tic took good care to destroy the evidence of his 
theft, and all trace of the fact that Clement of 
Alexandria had put in practice amon^ the Alex­
andrian Gnosticsa system of hierarchical govern­
ment essentially similar to that, which it is claimed, 
was from, and after the time of Eusebius adopted 
by the Christian Church. The spirit tells us that 
in copying his policy, “ the leaders of the Roman 
Catholic Church were to be Communists, but their 
followers were not allowed to become such.” It is 
therefore to be inferred that Cements’ fraternity 
of Communistic monks was the model after which 
the Christian priesthood copied in their efforts to 
monopolize power and wealth. Truly, there is 
nothing original whatever, connected with the 
•Christian religion, not even its most odious fea­
tures.

Not tbe least significant declaration ofthe spirit 
of Clement is, that in A. D. 161 the most renowned 
priests of the East and West, throughout the then 
civilized world, assembled in council at Alexan­
dria, embracing Gnostic, Gymnosophist and other 
sects, at which the idea was formed to adopt, as 
the symbol of a common worship, the body of the 
Grecian god, Prometheus, .suffering for mankind 
on the Scythian Crag to which should be attached 
•the head of Apollonius of Tyana. Whether 
Clement was himself a member of that Council of 
Gnostic, Gymnosophist and other priests, he does 
not tell us, but he does most plainly tell us that he 
wrote a full account of the decision they came to 
in regard to the common religious symbol they de­
termined to adopt. Nothing was more natural 
than that these Greek Gnostics and Gymnoso- 
phists should have adopted that especial emblem; 
and nothing more unnatural than that Christian 
prelates assembled in A. D. 665, at Constantinople, 
oy Constantinus Pogonatus, should have adopted 
that identical symbol as the emblem ofthe Christ­
ian religion. Who has ever seen a crucifix, or 
statue, or picture, representing Jesus of Nazareth, 
the alleged Jew, that had not every lineament 
and physical attribute of the highest Greek ideal 
of human perfection. To combine theideal beauty 
of Prometheus, the Greek savior, with the real 
beauty of the sage, the seer, the benefactor, the 
teacher—the renowned AppoUqnius—was indeed, 
to unite, in one emblem, all that was divinely and 
humanly perfect and adorable. That Christian 
prelates should have deliberately adopted this 
compound effigy of a heathen god and a heathen 
philosopher, as the emblem of their religion, was 
to confess the heathen origin and heathen nature 
of all that is connected with it. To-day* in every 
Christian church, the people in their ignorance, 
are worshiping the same objects that received the 
adoration of the heathen Greeks and Romans. If 
they desire to worship a Christian Jew, as they 
claim to be doing, let them at least discard an em­
blem that relates only to the theology concerning 
a Greek god, and the life and acts ofa Greek philo- 
sopherand teacher of men. Who will earn the 
thanks of unborn generations of men, by search­
ing for the writings of Clement, as they were origin­
ally composed, among the Maronite monks of Mt. 
Lebanon. That they are there, I feel confident, 
and the time may yet come when I can, myself, 
institute that search. Well may the spirit of 
Clement say: “ These, once in the possession of 
of moderns, and the whole fabric of Christianity 
will be stamped as a forgery.” I regard this com­
munication asofextraordinary importance in every 
way it may be viewed. It is beyond all question, 
a spirit communication, and there is no valid rea­
son for questioning its authenticity, The circum­
stances under which it was given, demonstrate 
the true and wonderful' mediumship of the 
maligned Alfred James. Em] ,

Charus Francis Dupuis.
Good Afternoon:—I do nqt believe in self­

laudation, but I will say for myself, that ho man 
ever existed On this planet, who sought for 
knowledge concerning religions more industrious­
ly than myself; and in this search, I found that 
from the time man had a history, down to the 
present time, in every age and generation 
there has been some one person who seemed to 
be the most progressed man of his time, and that 
be governed all, or the largest portion of people 
then living, and who, after his death, in almost 
everyjnstance, became a god.' This I think is the

starting point of all religions. Once get a central 
igure to start with, and then it is constantly added 
,o, and in this way gods become innumerable. 
There seems to be one idea running through all 
religions, and chat is this: “I want to be a rascal, 
but I want some one to redeem me from suffering 
tbe just deserts of my rascality.” From my re­
searches, both as a spirit and mortal, I am positive 
that the feast in honor of the Virgin Parturiens was 
celebrated twenty-three hundred years before the 
Christian era; and that this idea was well known 
in that day, or previous to it, can be proven, by 
any old Phoenician author now extant. The cross 
was well known, and Used to punish malefactors 
upon, or in other words, used to offer human sacri­
fices to God before the time of Hermes Trismegis- 
tus. That philosopher, king or priest, is the 
identical character referred to in Genesis under the 
name of Melchisedek. This I have found out as 
a spirit. In one of the works of Hermes, if it 
could now be found, that was one of his names. I 
have many other things to say, but unfortunately 
I have come too late at this sitting. The power is 
on the wane. I will endeavor to come again. I 
wrote about 1790. My name was Charles Dupuis.

[We take the following account of this truly 
learned man from the Nouvelle Biographie Generale. 
Ed.] ’ , ’ '

“ Charles Francois Dupuis, a French philosopher 
and statesman, born the 16th day of October, 1742, 
at Trie-le-Chateau, died near Dijon, the 29th of 
Septemrer,' 1809. He received from his father, 
who was a tutor by profession, the elements of 
his education, and at the age of ten years the 
pupil had already exhausted all that the master 
was able to teach. His course of studies was 
limited to the first principles of geometry as ap- 
Elied to surveying. There remained to tnq young 

'upuis no other expectation than to follow the 
modest duties of a tutor, as bis father was doing; 
but an apparantly insignificant circumstance de­
cided his future to be otherwise. His father went 
to take charge of a school at La Roche- 
Guyon, near Mantes. An ancient tower attract­
ed the attention of the youth, who tried to meas­
ure the height of it by trigonometrical methods. 
The Duke de La Rochefoucauld, proprietor of La 
Roche-Guyon, who accosted the youth while so en­
gaged, was as much charmed as astonished at his 
replies, and offered to permit him to pursue his 
studies, by promising him a scholarship at the 
College of Harcourt. After having commenced to 
learn the Latin language, first at La Roche-Guyon 
and afterwards at the College of Vernon, Dupuis 
was received at the College of Harcourt. By his 
rapid and brilliant progress he won the prize be­
stowed by the college and the university, a second 
gift from his benefactor, and obtained the posi­
tion of principal of Harcourt, this relieving him 
from expense, a favor which enabled him to aid 
his family that the death of his father had left in 
distress. His course of philosophy terminated, the 
young Dupuis received the degree of Master of 
Arts, and was then admitted to the university as a 
licentiate in theology, and was appointed, at the 
age of twenty-four years, professor of rhetoric at 
the College of Lisieux. Notwithstanding the 
labors of his professorship, he studied law, and 
was admitted as an advocate in 1770. At this 
epoch he gave up his ecclesiastical position, and 
married in 1775. That same year he made his debut 
in the.career of literature, by a Latin discourse, 
that the university chose him to pronounce in 
the presence of the parliament on the occasion of 
the distribution of prizes. In the funeral oration 
of Maria Theresa, that he pronounced in 1780 in 
the name of the university, he showed the talents 
ofa good Latinist. Mathematics were also the 
subject of his studies; and he followed, during 
several years, Laland’s course of astronomy, with 
whom he formed a close friendship. In 1778 he 
constructed a telegraph to correspond from Belle­
ville with a friend who had his residence at 
Bagneux.

“ It was at Belleville that Dupuis conceived the 
idea and commenced the execution of his great­
work on religion. The legends, the fictions, the 
allegories, the symbols, the traditions, all those 
myths the whole of which constitute polytheism, 
are of such different nature, that it is impossible 
to trace them to a common source. Notwithstand­
ing, it was this that Dupuis attempted.”

[ Space will not admit of quoting this biography 
further. I will only say that I have studied the 
works of Dupuis for the past twenty-six years, 
and that witli no other desire than to know the 
truth; and I feel fully justified in saying that no 
man has ever lived who has left such a monu­
ment of his vast erudition as has Dupuis in his 
great work, “L’Origins de tout lee cullet,” (Origin of 
alt Religions.) ■ Indeed so impressed was I with 
the importance-of his almost limitless rasearches 
that I translated his abridged edition of the larger 
work, with the view to publishing it, but when I 
was about to do so, my eyes were opened to the 
truth of Spiritualism, and through Dr. J. V. Mans­
field,of New York, I received the request from the 
spirit of the great French heretic, to forego my 
intention, as all that he had discovered and laid 
bare, would b6 put in. the shade by disclosures 
that would be made by the learned in spirit life. 
The communication above given is perfectly char­
acteristic of the man, ana consistent with his 
history. I regret he could not communicate more 
fully, and trust he will, return again, for I well 
know that he can throw a flood of light upon tho 
dark errors of religion.—Eo.]

or her patron saint. The twelve apostles, as they 
nowstaffd in 8t. Peter’s in Rome, are the exact 
counterpart of the first twelve consuls of the Ro­
man Empire. These statues stood in the temple 
of Mars, at Rome, and were there in A. D. 325. I 
was known, when here, as Basilius, since as St. 
Basil.

[ I take the following' concerning St. Basil from 
McClintock and Strong’s Encyclopaedia of Ecclesi- 
tical Literature.—Ed.]

" St. Basil (from Basilios),‘The Great,” one of 
the most eminent of the Greek fathers, was born 
about the end of the year 328, probably at Neo­
caesarea. He began his studies at Ctesarea, in 

•Palestine, whence he proceeded to Constantinople 
to hear the famot»Libaniu8,and thence to Athens, 
where he contracted an intimate frienship with 
Gregory Naziarizen. About355 he returned to his 
country, but soon after left his home again and 
travelled into Lybia, visiting the famous monas­
teries of those countries. Upon his return he was 
first made reader in the Church of Ctesarea, and 
afterwards ordained deacon. But about the year 
358 he retired into a solitude of Pontus, where he 
built a monastery near that of his sister Macrina, 
and with his brothers Peter and Naucratius, and 
several others, he followed an ascetic life, and 
drawing up a rule for his community became the 
founder of the monastic life in those regions. In 
364 he was ordained priest by Eusebius, and in 
369 or 370, on the death of Eusebius, he was 
elected bishop of Csesarea, after great opposition, 
which was finally overcome only by the personal 
efforts of the aged Gregory of Nazianzus. But the 
emperor Valens soon began to persecute him be­
cause he refused to embrace the doctrine of the 
Arians, of which he and Gregory of Nazianzus 
werestrenous opponents. The death of Valens’ 
soon gave freedom of action to Basil, who devoted 
his efforts to bring about a re-union between the 
Eastern and Western churches, which had been 
divided on points of faith, and in regard to Me- 
letius and Paulinus, two bishops of Antioch. The 
Western churches acknowledged Paulinus for the 
legal bishop; Meletius was supported by the East­
ern churches. But all his efforts were ineffectual, 
this dispute not being terminated till nine months 
after his death. Basil was also engaged in some 
contest relating to the division which the emperor 
had made of Cappadocia into two provinces. 
Eustathius, bishop of Sebaste, had been a friend 
of Basil, and had planted monasticism in Asia, a 
pursuit in which Basil fully sympathized; but 
Eustathius openly embraced Arianism and Basil 
in 373 broke with him and wrote against him. He 
also wrote against Apollinaria* in fact he took a 
part in most of the controversies of his age. He 
died January 1, 379, with these words on his lips: 
‘ Oh, Lord, into Thy hands I commend my spirit.’ 
Basil was a man of great piety, profound learning, 
and great eloquence. During the Arian contro­
versy he was an unflinching champion of the or­
thodox doctrine.” '

[Such was the man whose spirit communicated 
as above. We find no reference to any bloody 
deeds in the history of Gregory, and therefore in­
fer that any acts of violence of which he may have 
been the instigator have been concealed. His tes­
timony as to the influence which Christian spirits 

' exert oyer mortals is no less true than it is im­
portant. When such a bigoted Christian spirit 
returns to confess the mortifying fact that the 
Christian religion rests on wrong principles that 
doom it to early destruction, the time has truly 
come when the faithful friends of Truth, in her 
naked beauty, should take heart and rejoice. 
Who has seen the twelve statues referred toby 
this spirit? If anyone of my readers, they will 
do me a favor to say whether the features of 
those statues are Jewish or Grecian. If the latter, 
then is the spirit of Basil right regarding their 
character.—Ed. ]

Gratian—(A Roman Emperor.)
I don’t want to come here, but I am in a net. I 

am a caught fish. I might as well be candid for 
these spirits say they will not let me go until I 
tell the truth. They Wanted me to be a pope, but 
there wasn’t money enough in it,so I thought the 
best thing I could do was to rob the pagans of 
their riches. I do not think one class of heathens 
are worse than another. I mean by this that we 
were all heathens together. We took possession 
of what we wanted as tithes for the Lord, but the 
most of these tithes went into us priests. We 
were a holy set in our day. Any person who 
wanted law had to buy it, and I cannot say any­
thing for the justice of if even then.’ I only 
looked out for myself. I destroyed four books 
that would have been of great value to you mod­
erns. They were the writings of Bardesanes, the 
Gnostic, and the writings of Livius, cilled Livy 
by you moderns. I also destroyed five basso-re­
lievos of Apollonius; and it is but justice to you 
moderns that this should be known and ulti­
mately traced to me. My name was Gratian. I 
lived about A. D. 35!). .

[ We take the following account of Gratian from 
McClintock and Strong’s Encyclopedia of Ecclesi­
astical Literature.—Ed.] ■ .

“ Gratianus, emperor of Rome, son of Valentin- 
ian I, was born in 359, and on the death of his 
father, A. D. 375, succeeded to a share of the 
Western empire. 'On the death of his uncle 
Valens, A. D. 373, he obtained control of the 
whole empire; but in 379 he appointed Theodo­
sius his colleague, giving him the eastern pro­
vinces. He was killed A. D. 383 in a revolt in 
Gaul. Gratian was tolerant toward the various 
sects which divided Christianity, but he displayed 
a stern determination against the remains of the 
heathen worship. At Rome he overthrew the 
altar of Victory which continued to exist; he con­
fiscated the property belonging to the other priests 
and vestals. He also refused to assume, the title and 
the insignia of VondScx. Maximus,a dignity till then 
considered as annexed to that of emperor. These 
measures gave a final blow to the old worship of 
the empire; and although the Senators, who for 
the most part were still attached to it, sent him a 
deputation, at the head of which was Symmachns, 
they could not obtain any mitigation of his de­
crees.” .

[Such was the man whose spirit was forced to 
return and confess the part he had had in sup­
planting the Roman religion by and through 
Christianity. It was only through coercion that 
he was made to confess that his love for Christian­
ity was prompted by the five loaves and two 
fishes inducements which it held out to him. His 
destruction of the works of Bardesanes and Livy, 
and the sculptures of Apollonius of Tyana, have 
availed him nothing at least, for the fact of his 
villainy he has had to confess, after more than 
fifteen hundred years of silence. Truly the way 
of the transgressor is hard.

^. St. Basil.
Good Day:—You have in modern science the 

theory of the survival of the fittest. I come here 
to-day in the interest of the stuwival of truth. I 
was an ardent propagator of the Christian religion, 
and extremely bigoted. With this so-called sacred 
book in one hand and the sword in the other, I 
gave them the choice between what 1 considered 
right and death. But there is no religion, how­
ever long it may stand, if its principles are wrong, 
its destruction cannot be prevented. Only by the 
support of powerful spirits has the Christian re­
ligion been enabled to hold its own. In fact, 
mortals are governed more by Christian spirits Hum 
they think for. Once go where ihis element pre­
dominates and yon soon become, in struggling 
against it, so weak that you succumb, because it is 
popular. But the time is now ripe, and the har­
vest is nigh, when men and women will hang 
their heads in shame at the name of Christianity. 
I can see this as a spirit. As St. Gtegory, so- 
called, was the apostle of the West, so I was the 
apostle of the East, and the founder of the Greek 
Catholic Church, as it now exists in Russia. You 
are told by the followers of Romanism that when 
you see, in their churches, statues, and pictures of 
saints they are not placed there to worship, 
but only as reminders to be true to their faith. 

1 This is not so, for nearly every Catholic has his

Carr a.
Good Afternoon :—I lived, and was well ac­

quainted, with Jean Jacque Barthelemy; and he 
succeeded me in the National Library at Paris; •. 
We had many consultations together about his 
alphabet of Palmyra, and the inscriptions upon 
different ancient ruins; and he goes with me in . 
spirit. He is with me to-day, to say that in a 
town called Said, there is an inscription which de­
fines what is meant by the term Essene. Emeans 
fire, and sene means worshiper, or passer through, 
and in modern language would be termed wor­
shippers passing through purification by fire. The 
inscription was on a flat stone covering a vault, 
about two miles from Port Said, and in the Sa­
maritan tongue. And from other writings, as 
well as being so assured by one Ignatius of Anti­
och, in spirit, who was an Essene, both Barthel­
emy and myself have come to the conclusion that 
all converts had to pass through fire—termed fire 
baptism—in order to be initiated into Essenism. 
He has also to say that the inscriptions on the 
Adulian marble, after the first clause, ended by 
two arrows, one pointing towards the north and 
the other south, relate to the life and miracles of 
Apollonius of Tyana. [I here asked whether the 
obliterated portion of the inscription had refer­
ence to that subject. He replied:] It seems to 
have been chipped off so as to conceal its purport. 
This Apollonius is nearer to this earth, at this 
time, as a spirit, than he has ever been, and will 
probably, in materialized form, be enabled, before 
long, in person to claim to be the true Messiah, 
and in this way make a final end of Christianity. 
Not that he claims any Messiahship, but he was 
a superior medium. There is also great prepara­
tion being made for the coming of Henry Salt to 
communicate, and that will furnish all* that this 
band have to say upon the subject of the Chris­
tian religion. It will-perhaps take a couple of 
weeks yet before he will be enabled to control. 
This communication is for the benefit of truth. 
Carra.

[We take the following concerning Carra from , 
the Nouvelle Biographie Generale.—Ed.] •

“Jean Louis Carra, a French philosopher and 
statesman, was born in 1743, at Pont-de-Veyle, in 
Bresse, and died on the 31st of October, 1793. His 
parents, notwithstanding their limited means, 
made every possible effort to procure for him an 
honest education, when an unforeseen incident 
occurred which decided his fortune. He was 
vaguely accused of a theft, and fled, less, it is said, 
to escape the vigilance of justice, than to avoid 
the mortification of the suspicions that rested 
upon him. He at first, went into Germany, and 
afterwards into Moldavia, where he entered the 
service of the Hospodar. After the death of that 
sovereign, Carra returned to France; and by sin­
gular chance he found employment with a prineb 
of the church, Cardinal Rohan. At a later period 
the cardinal of Brienne, who had made his ac­
quaintance while with the archbishop of 8tras- 
burg, gave him his protection, and hrocufed him 
employment in the royal library. It is said that 
the idea of his Petit mot de reponse a la requite de 
M. de Calonne, was due to the latter prelate. How­
ever that may be, Carra saw; with enthusiasm, 
the first symptoms of the Revolution, in which he 
was not tardy in playing a conspicuous part. 
Named a candidate for the district of Filles-Saint 
Thomas, he incited the establishment of the com­
mune—that of the burgher guard, and, in concert 
with Mercier, the author of Tableaux, of Paris, 
published a journal under the title of Annales 
Palriotiques, At the tribunal of the Jacobins, he 
was one of the most earnest orators, and aided in 
rendering a declaration of war against Leopold, 
popular. He also founded the Journal de I’ Elat 
el du Ciloyen, in which he advocated the most 
democratic principles. He was a member of the 
Central Committee of the Federation, and was 
one of the leaders of the insurrection of August 
tenth, of which he had designed the plan. Nom­
inated by two departments of the national con­
vention, he chose the department of Saone-et- 
Loire, and sat at first with the left. He denounced 
the operations of General Montesquieu, who, . 
charged with the occupation of Savoy, did not 
terminate the campaign as promptly as they de­
sired. A short ttfrid after, he was sent to the camp 
of Chalons to watch Dumouriez, and to report to 
the convention some successes of Kellerman. On 
his return he was elected secretary, and proposed 
a plan of revolutionary propagandism. Upon the 
process against Louis XVI, he spoke in favorjof 
death without appeal or delay. But he soon 
abandoned the Mountain to unite with the Gi­
rondists, and was soon under suspicion by his 
connection with Roland, who had appointed him 
keeper of the National -Library; and by his rela­
tions with the Prince of Brunswick, successively 
denounced by Marat, Robespierre and Benta- 
bolle, he was recalled from Blois, where he had 
been sent on a mission, and was comprised among 
the forty-six deputies who were accused by Amar. 
Condemned to death on the 31st of October 1793, 
he was executed the next day.” .

[It was the spirit of this man, the friend and 
predecessor of the erudite Jean Jacque Barthele­
my, in the office of Librarian of the National Li­
brary, that returns, and through a medium who 
never so much as knew of his existence, commu­
nicates the interesting information above given. 
I doubt whether there has ever been any sue-—** 
cessful attempt to give the etymology of the term 
Essene, prior to this spirit exposition of it. That ' 
it is correct there can be little question. It would . 
seem that Barthelemy’s discovery of the inscrip­
tion at Said that explains the meaning of that 
term, has heen made since he became a spiril, 
thus showing that if the way is once fully opened 
to the learned in spirit life, they have it in their 
power to unravel and correctly explain every 
liistorical puzzle, concerning even tlie most re­
mote past. It is a fact, that purification by fire 
baptism was a common thing among those people, 
the object of whose worship was the sun. Will 
not some traveller ’to the Orient remember this 
spirit statement, and test its correctness, by visit-, 
ing Said and searching for the inscription de­
scribed. Doubtless there are those of the inhabi­
tants of that old Syrian town, who have seen tho 
stone and the inscription upon it. Ignatius of 
Antioch, to whom the spirit of Carra refers as 
having confirmed Barthelemy’s interpretation of 
the Samaritan word Essene, was not only an Es­
sene but he was the patriarch of that sect, and 
one of tho most learned men of his age. The 
spirit’s statement, on behalf of Barthelemy, that 
the incscription on the monument at Adalis, after 
the first clause, related to the life and miracles of 
Apollonius of Tyana, is undoubtedly correct, and 
hence the obliteration of it by some emissary or 
emissaries of the Christian church, whose piety 
far outstripped their honesty and truthfulness. •
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We were electrified by tbe assurance of the spirit, 
that the. great medium and sage Apollonius is 
nearer the earth, as a spirit, at this time than he 
has ever been before, and that he njayyetBuc- 
ceed in appearing in materialized form, and claita 
his own at the hands of the Christian hierarchy. 
In view of the great importance attached- by 
Spirits to the prospective communication of Henry 
Salt, we will look for it with the most profound 

, interest.
'Spiritualists, remember that the foregoing com­

munications were given in a public circle at the 
lake Pleasant Camp groundson Agust 18, through 
Alfred James, in the presence of many persons, 
among whom were the following well-known 
Spiritualists: Stephen Pearl Andrews, David 
Hoyle, Miss Hattie Allen, Emma J. Huff, Mr. 
and Mrs. Leavenworth; Mrs. Dr. VanCort, of 
New York; Mr. and Mrs. Wm. Healey,.ofBridge- 

’- ’port, Conn.; Mrs. N. H. Fogg, of Connecticut;
Luther 0. Weeks, of Vermont; J. D. Alvord, of 
Massachusetts; James Grisworld, of Amsterdam, 
N. Y.; ourself and others. So far as they are con­
cerned, therefore,5 we had no part in concocting 
them. I shall next week publish another se­
ries that were received, under similar circum­
stances, at a subsequent public seance at Lake 
Pleasant camp-ground. I trust these will suf­
fice to put a final end to the efforts of those who 
have sought, by their groundless misrepresenta­
tions, to rob returning ancient spirits of the credit 

. of their momentous disclosures through their 
' chosen medium, Alfred James, and at the same 

. time relieve the medium and myself from the 
unjust suspicions of persons who are themselves 
dishonest—Ed.]

■ ————^-^^->——————

The delay of the issue of our paper last week was 
©wing to our absence at Lake Pleasant Camp 
Meeting, which caused us to be two days behind 
hand.,- We shall endeavor to make partial amends 
by getting it out earlier than usual this week.

The Essence of Bundyism.
Editor Mind and Matter :

Bundyism is compounded of three ingredients, 
in equal parts,—affectation of respectability, self­
conceit, and hypocrisy, summed up in one word, 
—Pretension. Dickens had Bundyism in his 
mind’s eye, when he created Mr. Pecksniff. The 
best specimen of Bundyism in actual life, after 
" Col.’ Bundy himself is “ Wm. Emmette Cole­
man, Presidio, of San Francisco, Cal.” This crea­
ture, with an intense itchipg for notoriety, but 
without brains or character enough to succeed in 
any orthodox; conservative or aristocratic circle, 
comes into Spiritualism as a new movement, and 
evidently has the ambition of many a half-baked 
new-comer, “to show the natives how to do it." 
With not a-particle of mediumistic capacity, with 

’ noinsightorspiritual intuition, with no knowledge, 
except what may result from “ cramming” for the 
occasion and ransacking public libraries in order 
to appear very learned, this scribbling pretender 
sets up as a cansor of mediums and a critic of 
Spiritualism and its grand philosophy; and the 
Religioso-'Philosophisler’s Journal says he is “ noth­
ing if not critical.” Now, what is the matter with 
this lean-souled and “lean-cheeked maniac ofthe' 
tongue and pen?” Why, he is afflicted with 
Bundyism. That is, he wishes to appear very re­
spectable, he wishes to appear very learned, he 
wishes to appear very critical, so that the ortho­
dox and conservative people, on whom Bundyism 
(instantly has its eye, may say, "0, Spiritualism 
is full of frauds and disreputable people; but still 
there are Coleman, and Bundy, and Tuttle, they 
redeem it a little, they will mot afiiliate with 
Mansfield, and Bliss, and Eddy, &c., Ac.” And 
that, of course, makes Coleman A Co. very proud 
and so full of pretension and inflation they that 
hunt up another poor medium to make a victim of. 

- ' Having found one, they give play to' the boor­
ish brutality, the unclean egotism, the cheap, va­
poring sentimentalism, the crafty, cuttle fish, 
cowardly cant, which characterizes the whole 
tribe. Take up any issue/if the /?. P.J., and every 
page is redolent of the pretension, the affectation, 
the Pecksnillism of Bundyism. From the great 
boor, Bundy himself, down to the Sir Jabesh 
Windbag, and Jefferson Brick of Spiritualism, 

' W,m. Emmette Coleman, the “ Presidio ” beauty, 
the same quackery, the same upstart assumption 
is manifest. . I thank God for the sun and moon, 
and for Mind and Matter. I thank God that the 

• “insolent light” has been let in upon the putrid 
nastiness of Bundyism, that the veil has been' 
stripped from these upstarts, charlatans and hypo­
crites, and that they now stand with nothing to 

■ cover their nude, unvarnished vulgarity.
The invisibles can get along without Bundy or 

. Coleman; they will have mediums, and while 
justice reigns, and truth will have a hearing, 
these vain, high-stepping, dyspeptic, uneasy vaga- 

- bonds will not be'allowed to put out the lights 
of Spiritualism, and Bundyism and Peeksniflism 

, and pretension and literary quackery will be 
buried together. -

E. A. Waldo.
' Lowell, Mass., August 13th, 1881.

KIND WORDS.
CHiram Gardner, Brashear, Mo., whites: “May 
God and the angels hold up your hands in your 
noble stand for tlie right.”

J. D. Pierson, San Francisco, Cal., writes: “It 
is the best Spiritual paper to be found on the Pu- 

. cific coast, because the most honest and truthful, 
and the most persistent in upholding the much- 
abused mediums.”

J. W. Engle, Tonganoxie, Kansas, writes: “ En­
closed please find two dollars for the paper, Mind 
and Matter * * * I value it highly.
I think yon are.handling the thing about right, by 
the truth, if you even have to do it a little roughly.

Submit C. Ixiomis, Brooklyn, N. Y., writes: " I 
have not received the last two numbers of your 
highly prized Mind and Matter; I regret the 
absence of so much interesting news from the 
ancient spirits. I with and will you to succeed.

Julia, Dwelley, South Hanover, Mass., write s: 
“ It has been a greht relief to my mind to read 
your paper. I do love the truth, and love to see 
those who uphold the truth and live by tlie truth. 
Ill-health prevents my going into society. If it 
were not for my paper, I should be very lonely.”

E. H. Evans, Byron, Ills., writes: “I was at 
■ Rockford, yesterday, and bought an articlej and 
it was wrapped up in a newspaper. On picking it 
up this morning I discovered that it was a paper 
that I had not heard of, and I became interested 
in its contents and I wish you to send me sample 
copy.”

F. 8, Davis, Princeton, Ill., writes: “ I am "put 
to great anxiety when your paper don’t come. Igreat anxiety when your paper don’t come. I oil and candies from ^antucket to Philadelpnia. 

id forgotten the time to renew. You will find The mate, however, was not a Friend. The vesselhad forgotten _____
enclosed the price for' one year. Please put me 
down for one of your books. Hang on to the helm 
of Mind and Matter; don’t yield for fear of the 
devil or his gold. Oh! the glorious work, as I 
believe you and the good angels are accomplish-
ing.” • ■ i

B. F.'Ward, Lower Lake, Cal., writes: “ I feel j 
that the doctrine that you advocate comes the j 
nearest to reaching the throne of God that ever 
was preached ou the face of this earth. Friend 
Roberts, I don’t think you will turn to a pillarof 
salt, as Lot’s wife did, for you don’t stop to 
look back, but keep pushing ahead, thank the 
spirit world, in your good work, and may you 
ever continue so . doing. I feel when I receive 
Mind and Matter like a hungry chicken pick-1 
ing up corn: I can’t stop until I get it all.” j

John C. Davenport, San Jose, Cal., writes: “ I j 
greet you once more in the cause of truth, in I 
which you. are engaged so nobly, and so thor­
oughly exemplify and spread out in Mind and 
Matter, for all that will take and read it. May 
the good and true spirits ever surround you and 
guide you into all truth. I never expected to 
live to see the truth verified in this wor d, as it .is 
in Mind and Matter. 1 am now travel ing on in 
my 81st year; when I first subscribed for the 
paper, I thought it very doubtful that I. should 
live the year out to read it; but as I am still here, 
I venture to try it one year longer. Accept my 
best wishes for your success.”

J. J. Huber, Mechanicsville, Iowa, writes; “ En 
closed I send two dollars to apply on my sub­
scription to Mind and Matter. From an ac­
quaintance with the sacred canon of the Old and 
New Testament, the lexicons and the views of 
the classic Fathers; and from my experience in 
the study of the natural laws of the universe, and 
as a minister of the Evangelical Theology of the 
present age, for a period of thirty-two years: and 
from my experience with the life of those mental 
forces, that fill all there is of existence, ! consider 
Mind A\d Matter, as it comes every week scat­
tering the rays of light and love it is enabled to 
gather from the universe (the only reliable Bible 
God ever made) the best paper published in the 
world in the interests of humanity. The commu­
nications from ancient spirits through Alfred 
James, I personally know to be of more interest 
to humanity than all the theological writings of 
the last 1800 years; and Bro. James I consider 
one of the most wonderful mediums on earth 
to-day for the spirit world to use in making us 
acquainted with the past history of the world. 
The angel world are accomplishing a great work 
through our friend Dr. A. B. Dobson. They use 
him to overturn the tables of the money changers 
and to show them more light and truth in ii very 
few minutes than all the ministers of the priest­
hood have been able to divine'for the last 1800 
years. * * * I would give up everything be­
fore your paper; and I say bless a man of prin­
ciple.”

Letter from James A. Bliss.
Dear/Friend:—Wo are “holding forth” in 

Providence, R. I., every evening, and making 
converts that never sawn materialized form, be­
fore attending our seances. Shall remain here 
surely until the first of next week. ’ ' S :

Your editorial upon your visit to Lake Pleasant 
was grand. I never read so fine an article in my 
life. Such impartiality towards all speakers, me­
diums, and workers in the cause was never shown 
before. Who can doubt that you are, and always 
have been right in the stand you have taken in 
the defense of the phenomena. Send me some 
samples of Mind and Matter for distribution in
my circles. ■Yours, truly, 

James A' Bliss.

Ona recent Sunday, when the pastor of one of 
the leading churches of St. Louis was absent from 
his pulpit, several persons expressed dissatisfac­
tion at seeing a stranger in tho pulpit, and ope 
lady siiid-she would not have come if she had 
known that Dr.---- was not going to preach. An 
elder standing near very promptly replied: 
“Madame, the worship of Dr.---- will be re­
sumed next Sunday.”

A colored postmaster in South Carolina recently 
’'sent a long petition to the Department, praying 
to be relieved from Sunday work. He recited 
that his objections did not arise'from laziness or 
aversion to the work itself, but that his religious 
scruples forbade any kind of work on the sabbath. 
He was informed by the Department that his 
only remedy lay in a resignation of his office, and 
since (hen nothing more has been heard from 
him. /

Disciples of the Salvation Army are treated 
with the grossest brutality in London streets, and 
few efforts appear to be made by the police for 
their protection. To stone, kick, and otherwise 
assault them, is a common thing, while their 
places of worship are invaded and taken posses­
sion of, and packs of ruffians, organized by vir­
tuously indignant gin dealers, hunt them out in 
their, noisy goings through the worst precincts 
of the East End. Recently a young scoundrel 
took a rope, and, from one side Of a street, 
lassoed a member of the army while he was 
standing in It porch- on the other. He then 
dragged him into the street and kicked him. 
Two months of hard labor was in this case 
meted .out -to this ruffian, but in many instances 
outrages less gross in brutality; hot still a-dis­
grace to civilized life, are passed ny unnoticed.

No Complaint from the Horses.—On tbe line of 
morch from Varna to Baltshie I had to s)op .at a । 
small Bulgarian village, where one of our divis- 
sions was to halt for the night. 1 found a French 
dragoon regiment which had been on detatch- 
ment there for several weeks. Accosting the 
Colonel, I inquired what facilities there were for 
obtaining forage near the village, ahd lip gave me ' 
ample information on the subject with great cor- j 
diality. He was a lihe old soldier, of the rough- 
and-ready type, who had seen hot work, as lie . 
called it, in Algeria. A decidedly alcoholic tint j 
about his nose betrayed the fact that he was a I 
fire-drinker as well as a fire eater. I went on , 
to ask him about the water,. “The water?” he 1 
repeated, with a tone of unfeigned astonishment. 
“ Well, yes, Colonel,” replied I. “ Is the water 
good ? is it drinkable ?” “ Faith," said he, with 
a tone of contempt, " I know nothing about it. 
My horses don’t complain.” The gallant sabreur 
had never tasted the .water himself, _as it would 
appear. '

Cromwell B-— was a Quaker captain, bringing 
atucket to Philadelphia.

was lying on Sunday morning at Chestnut street 
wharf when a large ship came up. The mate of 
the incoming ship seemed determined to usurp 
the place of Cromwell B-----’s vessel. His quiet
remonstrance having no effect, he went to the 
cabin gangway and called for his first officer, who 
was below shaving for Sunday, “ Mate, I think 
thee’ll have to come up here and use some of thy 
language.” The mate soon appeared, half shaved, 
and poured forth a volley of oaths. The officer of 
the incoming ship said, “ I guess we’ll have to 
move; they’ve got some one else on board besides 
that---- old Quaker.”

Don't Fall to Improve This Opportunity.
To any person who wilbsubscribe for Mind and 

Matter for one year, I will send to order of no? 
tice from the editor of the same, either a clairvoy­
ant examination for disease, about its curableness, 
etc.; or a prescription of vegetable remedies; or a 
vital healing treatment by prepared paper or 
other vehicle; or a communication from a named 
spirit person or friend; or a brief delineation of 
character; or information and advice about a 
stated matter of business, or relating to social or 
matrimonial affairs as desired. All disorders and 
infirmities come within the sphere of this treat­
ment for help and cure; considering and including 
as diseases, tne love foFOr habit of using tobacco, 
opium and intoxicants; or obsession, causing fits, 
insanity' and other irregularities. Can, upon ex­
amination. readily determine whether obsessed, 
and if so, by bodied or disembodied spirits. No 
person can'have a thorough application of this 
vital healing treatment without being either 6s- 
sentially physically and spiritually benefitted, 
progressively restored to health, or immediately 
and permanently cured. Will forward to the 
order of present subscribers and other persons, 
either as above, for one dollar and ten cents re­
ceived,' same as to new subscribers.- In all cases 
send a lock of the applicant’s hair or recent hand 
writing, with statement of real name, age, sex, 
description of disorder, or the subject and object 
sought, and ten cents or more, to pay postage and 
writing expences. Address,

Dr. G. Amos Peirce, 
P. 0. Box 129, Lewiston, Maine.

—:o:-----
Generous Offer by a Well-known Cincinnati Medium.

To those who will subscribe to Mind and Mat­
ter for six months I will giveasitting for business 
or otherwise, by a 'card from J. M. Roberts, the 
editor, free of charge. This offer to hold good for 
as long as Mind and Matter exists.

Mrs, A. M. George, 
Rooms 14 and 15, 114 Mass Ave.

Indianapolis, Ind.
—.-o:-;—

A Mediums Valuable Offer.
Grand Rapids, April 20,1880.

Dear Brother:—Seeing that through the columns 
of Mind and Matter, a work can. be done to the 
advancement of spiritual progress, I thought I 
would make the following offer. Any person 
sending me $2.00 and two three cent stamps, I will 
give either a medical examination or business 
consultation; and will forward the same to you to 
secure to them Mind and Matter for one year.

Yours respectfully, 
■ Mrs. Dr. Sayles,

305 Jefferson Ave., Grand Rapids, Mich.
, -----:o:-----

Dr. R. D. Goodwin’s Grand Offer.
Having been a constant reader of your valuiible 

paper, and believing it should be in the house, of 
every progressive family, wo make the following 
offer, to stand good for one year. We will correctly 
diagnose any disease, or give one treatment to 
any .new subscriber to your paper, on their send­
ing the price of ono year’s subscription, with post­
age and request for our services. Address Dr. R. 
D. Goodwin, New York Eclectic Institute, 1317 
Morgan Street, St. Louis, Mo. For advertisement 
see seventh page. .

—:o:—

A Most Valuable Offer—Spirit Obsession Diagnosed.
Brother Roberts :—You may say in your paper 

that I will give a free examination of persons who 
would like to know whether they are obsessed or 
not, if they will subscribe for Mind and Matter 
nix months or one year. Any person accepting 
tliis offer must send -a note from you to that effect. 
All applications by letter must contain a lock of 
hair of tho applicant, ago, sex, etc., and ono three- 
cent postage stamp. Address B. F. Brown, Box 

j 28, Lewiston, Maine. This proposition to remain 
i open until further notice. B. F. Brown. 
j [We regard tho abo-,e proposition of Mr. Brown 
I as a most important one to tlie afflicted apart from 
| the interest we have in it.—Ed.] 

: -----:o:-----

' A Vltapathlc Physician's Kind offer.
i Any person sending mo $2.00 and two 3-cent 
postage stamps, with lock of their hair, age, sex, 
and leading symptoms and location of their dis­
ease,! will give tnem a free examination and ad­
vice, and send the two dollars to pay for Mind

I and Matter” for them one year. " 
i .1. B. Campbell, M. D., V. 1).
! 260 Longworth St., Cincinnati, Ohio.

. ----- :o:-----
Dr. J. Matthew Shea's Liberal Offer. ,

Bro. Roberts:—If.you will say to the public that 
any one who will subscribe through me for Mind 
and Matter for one year, I will give them, one 
private sitting and one ticket to my Materializing 
Seances; this to hold good until further notice.

.JffSEi'h Matthew Shea, M. D., 
87 West Madison St., Chicago, Ill.

-----:o:-----

Dr. Dobson’s Liberal Offer.
For the purpose of extending the circulation of 

Mind and Matter, I make the following ofl’er to 
any person sending me $1.25 and two 3-cent stamps 
they will receive Mind and Matter for six months, 
and I will answer ten questions of any bind and 
examine any diseased person free (by independent 
slate writing). Send lock of hair, state age and 
sex and leading symptons.

Maquoketa, Iowa.] r - Dr. A. B. Dobson.

Offer of Mrs. T. P. Allen.
Any person sending me $2.00 and wlth.it their 

hand writing, age, and sex, with two postage 
stamps for answer; I will give them a Psycho­
metric reading, and will forward their money 
to you to pay for a year’s subscription to Mind 
and Matter. _

■ Mrs. T. P. Allen, ' .
.. Box 77, Gowanda, N. Y.

---- :o:-----
An Extraordinary Offer of Dr. A. B. Dobson.

Dear Brother:—You Can say to the readers of 
your noble paper, that any diseased person who 
will send me two 3ct. postage stamps, a lock of 
hair, age and sex, and. one leading symptom, I 
will diagnose their case free by independent slate’ 
writing.

. .. -----:o:-----
Dr. J. C. Phillips’ Liberal Offer. 4

Omro, Wis., Jan.,14,1880.
Bro. Roberts .'—You can say in yonr paper that 

any one subscribing for your paper through me, 
and sending stamps to prepay answer, will receive 
a psychometrical reading; or should they prefer a 
medical examination by giving two or tWee lead­
ing symptoms, (to facilitate) will receive the latter. 
Send lock of hair. Dr. J. C. Phillips,

Psyohamelrist, Clairvoyant and Magnetic Healer,
---- :o:—

A Chicago Medium’s "Generous Offer.
■ No. 7 Laflin St cor of Madison St 

To those who will subscribe through ma for 
Mind and Matter one year, I will give a sitting 
for spirit tests. This oner to hold good for six 
months from date. Yours Respectfully,

Mrs. Mary E. Weeks,

SPIRITUAL PUBLICATIONS.

THE SPIRITUAL OFFERING
A Large Eight Page Journal, Devoted io ths Interests of Hu­

manity from a Spiritualistic and Scientific Standpoini.
Issued Weekly al Newton, Iowa.

D. M. & Nettie P. Fox, Editors and Publishers
THE OFFERING will be conducted Independently, im­

partially. Nothing looking to man’s welfare will be deemed 
alien to ita pages. Offensive nersonalities and indelicacy ot 
language will be wholly excluded. In Its editorial conduct 
tho truth, beauty and utility of Spiritualism in its higher 
phases will bo advanced. It will not, in any particular no a 
sectarian journal, but broad, progressive, and liberal—will 
give fair and equal expression to all forms of thought. 
Above all things, it aims to -be Liberal, to be devoted to 
Spiritualism in its broadest, highest, most extensive appli­
cation.

Among its'eontributors will bo found our oldest, ablest 
writers. In it will bo found Lectures, Essays upon Scientific, 
Philosophical, and Spiritual subjects; Spirit Oommunica­
tions and Messages. In No. 1, Vol. IV., or date September 

' . a now Inspirational Story was commenced, entitled, 
"Mysteries of tho Border Land; or, Tlie Unconscious Side 
of Conscious Life," by Mrs. Nettie P, Fox.

, TERMS OF SUBSCRIPTION. .
Per Year........................................................................... 81 00
Six Months......................   00
Three Months..-...............................................................  25

THE SPIRITUAL OFFERING and Mud and Nailer, an 
Eight page weekly paper published in Philadelphia, earn­
estly devoted to tho advocacy of Spiritualism, will bo sent
postage of both papers paid for 82.60, six months 81.25, The 
papers may bo ordered horn either oflice.

Upon the above terms the OFFERING will bo sent for 
the time paid for, to all who subscribe during the first six 
months. If our circulation shall hove reached 5,000 it will 
be continued at the same price; If not, tlio price will be ad­
vanced to one dollar and fitly cents per annum. By earnest 
effort, and tho aid of friends, wo oonlidonlry expect to get at 
least tho 5.000. Address, I). JI. and NETTIE P. FOX,

Newton, Iowa.

Banner of Light.
THE OLDEST JOURNAL IN THE WOULD DEVOTED TO THE 

SPIRITUAL PHILOSOPHY. ISSUED WEEKLY.

At No. 9 Montgomery Place, Boston, Mass.

COLBY & RICH, Publishers and PaoruiETORS.

Isaac B. Rich, - • Business Manager.
Luthkk Coi.hv, - - Editor.
John W. Dav, - - Assistant Editor.

Aided by a large corps of able writers.

THE BANNER Is a first-class, eight-page Family News­
paper, containing forty columns of interesting and in­
structive reading, embracing, 
A LITERARY DEPARTMENT.
REPORT OF SPIRITUAL LECTURES.
ORIGINAL ESSAYS-Upon Spiritual, Philosophical and 
Scientific Subjects. .
EDITORIAL DEPARTMENT.
SPIRIT-MESSAGE DEPARTMENT.
CONTRIBUTIONS by the most talented writers in the 
world, etc., etc.

TERMS OF SUBSCRIPTION, IN ADVANCE.
Per Year,..................................................................... 18 00
Hix Months,  ....................................................................... 1 50
Three Months,...............................................................75

“ LICHT FOR ALL,”
A Monthly Journal devoted to the Interests of Modern Spir­
itualism. Terms, $l per year; 10copies,80. Published by 
tho "Liglit for All" Publishing Company, A. 8. Winchester,’ 
Manager, 814 Clay 8t, Address all communications to P. O. 
lidx 1,097. Ban Friuiolaoo, Cal. Being tho only Spiritual pa­
per on tlio Pacific coast and circulating in Idaho,• Montana, 
New Mexico, Arizona, Colorado, California, Oregon, Wash­
ington, Nevada and British Columbia. It Is an admirable ad­
vertising medium, reaching tho most Intelligent portion of 
the population of this section ofthe United Slates.

THE VOICE OF ANCELS?
Eight pages, published at No. 9 Dwight Nt., Bowton. 

Munn., tho 1st an >! 15th of ouch month,
Si'iiUT L. JUDD PARDEE. Editor-in-Ohlof.

" D. K. MINER, Business Manager.
” " D. C. DENSMORE, Publisher. ,
Price yearly..................................................81 60 in advance.
Six months  ................................   76 "
Throe months...............................................- 40 "
Single copies............................   7 "

The above rates-include postage. Specimen copies sent 
free on application nt this office. All letters and oommuni­
cations (to receive attention) must be directed (postpaid) to 
M. B. Sl’RAGfE.

' THE QUARTERLY

ADVANCE AND REVIEW.
Devoted to tho interests of Modern Spiritualism. A large 

eight page journal, issued on tho 1st day of Juno, September, 
December nnd Marell. Subscription price, 25 cte. per year; 
live copies, 81; sample copies free. Select advertisements 
inserted at 25 cte. per line. Clrculatfon, 25,000.

As Advance and Review will circulate in every village, town 
irtid city in tho United States no better medium can be found. 
Ono trial is sufficient lo prove the trulli of this assertion.

JAMES A. BLISS, Editor and Publisher, 
713 Sansom 8t., Philadelphia, Pit.

TRiJTH, THE IMG SWf. '
A New Spiritual Journal, edited and published by LUOY 

L. BROWNE, No. 224)4 First St., Portland, Oregon. ’ 
Subscription one year, 81.00; Six Months, 50cento; Three 

Months,-25 cents; Single Copy, 10 cents, - ,
USUAL DISCOUNTS TO AGENTS.

J
9.^ ..........

wlth.it


MIND AND MATTER. [SEPTEMBER 3, M.S.84,]

PhiladblvhiI, Saturday, September 3, M. 8. 84,

]&• Entered at the Poet Office al Philadelphia, Pa., 
as secon&dass mailer.

publication office, 
Second Story, No. 713 Sansom Street, 

. PHILADELPHIA.

J. M-Bobbets Publisher and Editor

c BATES OF ADVERTISING.
Each line of nonpareil type, fifteen cents for the first inser­

tion, and half this rate for each subsequent insertion.
Business Cards and Continued Advertisements inserted at 

special isles.
Electrotypes and plates will not be inserted.
Payment strictly in advance.
Advertisements intended for insertion, must be left at the 

office by noon of each Wednesday.

TERMS OF SUBSCRIPTION.
To mall subscribers. 12.00 per annum; 81.00 for six months;

50 cents' fprUuJeeimonths, payable in advance.
Single ooplep of Die paper, five cents—to be had at the 

prlncTpal'news stands.

CLUB RATES FOR ONE YEAR.
Five copies, one year, free of postage.
Ten “ “ “ .
<Twenty“ “ “ “ .

4 8.00 
. 15.00 
.30.00

This is aqflehdid opportunity for MWB Agente in all parts 
qf Uie country, to realize aliaqilsonie profit without invest- 
neUieir casn capital? ” • .■
. AF’Anonj'nioua .communications cannot be printed In 

this paper. Nampa andaddresses should always be given, 
which Will’be" considered confidential, unless otherwise 
expressed.1 ■'•'•'. » :”‘ ' ■ ; ■

DR. J. V. MANSFIELD, 
THE WORLD RENOWNED WRITING MEDIUM, 

will answer sealed letters at No. 61 West Forty-Second St., 
New York City. Terms, 83.OC and four 3-cent stamps. 
Register your letters. . ,

Instructions to Those Who Desire Answers 
. to Mealed Letters. ,

In writing to tlie departed, tlie spirit should lie always 
addressed by full name and the relation they bear the writer, 
or one soliciting the response. Seal your letters properly, 
but not stitch them, as it defaces tlie writing matter. The 
etters, to secure attention, must lie written In tlie English 
anguage.
4^-OiDee Regulations and Requiremeiits.'VM 

One Seance of an hour, witli one person in his presence, 85.00

do away, absolutely, with all creeds and supersti­
tions, and establish in their stead, circles of in­
struction, whereby the people, now ignorant and 
greatly held to believe in error through igno­
rance, will be informed and educated to an under­
standing of such sciences as are needed for the 
work and business of eveiy-day Jife, and ad­
vancementin the knowledge of the more abstruse 
subjects of human inquiry. Where now stand 
churches devoted to the instruction of a mistaken 
supernaturglism, fodndeduppn the darkest of 
ante-diluvian and fabled error and superstition— 
because the poor people can thus be held the bet­
ter under control, who are made almost slaves to 
support a needless class of people in the world- 
are to be changed into public auditoriums, 
or caravansaries, where true knowledge as 
to the laws of nature; of life,; of being, of 
•growth, of heredity, of temperance, and of all 
the virtues, upon entirely scientific principles, 
will be imparted. For it will be discovered, soon, 
that the sentimental, religious and spiritual ten­
dencies of man are natural, and only natural., 
There cannot be anything higher than nature, 
nor outside ‘bf it. But we are not to discuss these 
important matters at this time. Our mission, no’w 
is, more particularly, to declare them. Spiritual­
ism is to be, and now is, the grand and important 
feature of the world, Ite workers, now, in both 
spheres—the mortal and spiritual—are beyond 
enumeration. They never can be correctly num­
bered until such time as the whole world shall 
become of one heart and one mind. Nor is there 
any need of a census of Spiritualists, It cannot be 
made. Its work and its converts are where no 
mortal inquiries can reach them, or publicly enu­
merate them. Yet they are almost everywhere; 
at least they are to be found among all orders of 
people, though many persons who are ignorant of. 
the work of Spiritualism, know nothing of their 
mental and spiritual advancement through con­
viction of its truths. The spirit world, however, 
has thorough information as to the matter.

But to leave this topic lor the present. I am re- 
qitested to state, that the Spirit Congress are con­
sidering the chances of recovery for President 
Garfield, The report is, that they think he will 
recover, though he will come very near to the 
spirit spheres. Every effort will be made to guide 
to the right treatment in his case. If persons sus­
ceptible to spirit influences can be kept near the 
patient, spirit physicians and surgeons of great 
eminence and power can approach him and work 
oyer him,andhe will surely recover, and that speedily. 
Do for us all you can in this direction, Brother 
Roberts,/or 17 is of the very greatest importance to 
the welfare of this country that President Garjield 
should live. We think he 'will get well, and yet do a 
grand work for freedom, civilization and progress.

We think, Brother Roberts, (from your thoughts 
which we come in rapport wilh), that you are not 

■ unawareof the conspiracy to destroy Mind and 
Matter, before alluded to by us. You huve a sly, 
malicious, selfish, traitorous enemy to contend 
against, who think they will be serving right and 
justice by destroying Mind and Matter, and 
gaining theapprovalof enlightened and progressed 
spirits, God, and the highest angels, by accom­
plishing this nefarious scheme.,. Beware of the 
friendship of such persons and the spirits they at­
tract to them, They are the Benedict Arnolds of 
Spiritualism, who would sacrifice it to gratify their 
own selfish desires, ,

Through the influence of spirits, MinDi and 
Matter whs introduced to the world, as was the 
glorious old Danner of Light, and its proprietors, 
yourself, and all Spiritualists may rest assured 
that both papers will be sustained and prospered. 
They will become more and more popular, and 
sought for by a thinking, reading, and reasoning 
people. They will triumph over all opposition, 
for the editors, proprietors, and managers, are all 

ifaithfql, earnest, and true to the cause of Spirit­
ualism and to the spirit world. '

Very truly, spiritually and fraternally for Truth, 
Charily and Progress.

One “ J^ hour. 3.00

INDEPENDENT SLATE WRITING.
SOMETHING NEW AND RELIABLE.

' If you will «en<l DR. A. B. DOBSON One Dollar and lock 
■ of Iwir, lie will answer you twenty question* or lens by 

Independent slate writing, on love, courtship, marriage, 
disease, or business of any kind or nature. • Make your 
questions plain, and he will guarantee the answers to be 
reliable. He lias answered hundreds of letters and given■ 
tho very best satisfaction. Reference, Editor Mind and 
Mailer. Address DR. A. B. DOBSON, Maquoketa, Iowa.

• SIGNIFICANT SPIRIT COMMUNICATIONS.
The following very significant communications 

have been received by us, and. we do not feel at 
liberty to withhold them from our readers, al­
though too complimentary to ourself. That they are 
authentic we are satisfied, if it is possible to au­
thenticate any spirit communications whatever. 
The first is as follws:
To the Editor of Mind and Matter:
Dear Mortal Brother:—We know you have 

very reliable mediums,or channels of communica­
tion with the spirit spheres,—one especially—a 
noted medium—Alfred James; beside, manv 
others, though upon 'different planes of life. Yet 
we find it important to transmit a few lines 
through the organism of this medium, wilh 
whom we have been acquainted for many years, 
and whom we have occasionally controlled for 

• our communications. Your own susceptibility to 
spirit associations, and your widely known lib­
eral political, religious and humanitarian princi- 
pies, make it very easy and pleasant for us to 
communicate, through this medium, with you.

As a member and representative of the great 
Spiritual Congress, now in session, and consid­
ering the all-absorbing question of human liberty, 
we invite your attention particularly to the agi­
tation now going on amongst all creedal orders

George Washington.

• and monarchical and imperial governments. The 
minds of men have become so much enlarged by' 
the lights of Liberty and Beason, that the bonds, 
that'hold enthralled the peoples, stand many 
chances of being severed, to give limited freedom ■ 
at first, and then to irogress unto complete and 
entire liberty. The t icological spheres are being 
so wrought upon by t lose principles of.light, that 
priestcraft with many is becoming a secondary 
affair—generally so with the educated. Whether 
they think proper to demonstrate their senti- 

' mente or not, it is all the same; the cause of
Freedom is advancing. You are doing a noble 
and needful work with Mind .and Matter. Its 
teachings are entering into the.deepest thoughts 
and feelings of the multitudesr Its work, its in­
fluence, and its circulation are to grow and extend 
far and wide. It will reach many minds and 
households that have been, hitherto, extremely 
bigoted and narrow in their religious views. Suc­
cess and prosperity is stamped all over its truth- 
advocaling folds. Spirits are very zealous in its 
favor. " No such good work—so deep, bold and 
reliable”-ythey say, “ was ever done before—es­
pecially since the days of the learned ancients.” 
The renowned and enlightened minds of the past 
arc very joyful about the grand and glorious re­
sults, incident to the influence of Mind and Mat­

- ter. You can safely depend upon tho assistance 
of all spirits and angels in diffusing Ihe senti­
ments of your paper, and also in bringing lo your 
aid all possible material and spiritual assistance. 
We make this public statement to defeat, by a 
flank movement and center advance, at the right 
moment, an organized conspiracy against ihe 
spread of trulli through its circulation. The work 
begun must not be abandoned to the will and 

' purposes of tyrants, bigots and zealots; nor for 
creeds, wealth, and honor, among men; nor for a 
slip-shod Spiritualism that steals coward-like and 
slily around,-seeking for knowledge and oppor­
tunities. Ite freedom, its wisdom, its flag of truth, 
must be shown, and spread to the-breezeof public 
opinion and investigation, upon the highest and 
most advanced outposts of light and education. 
No one need fear the effects of the light and 
truths of Spiritualist. These will harm no one. 
Its mottos are, love, mercy, truth, equality, jus­
tice, progress and knowledge. It does good to all 
—blesses all with peace and contentment who 

-have a knowledge of its teachings. Jt invites all 
to accept its joy-giving blessings. Spiritualism will

Never have we received a communication from 
spirit-life that we regarded of more pregnant sig­
nificance. Wesense its import; and will watch 
the signs of the times! And when the time for 
speech and action comes we will not be far from 
the front and not too late to fake a hand in the 
rescue. To say more, now, would be unwise.

Through Mrs. Twing, at th? same sitting, we re- f 
ceived the following, written in the same way. 
Mrs. Twing asked us to write a name and fold it' 
so as to be unreadable, and she would see whether 
she could get a response. We wrote 8. 8. Jones. 
On taking the paper in her hand, without looking 
at it;she said, “I hear the name Jones—nothing 
but Jones—8. S. Jones. What does that mean? I 
know you don’t want that.” We replied, “Write 
anything that comes to you and I will be satis­
fied.” Then this was written.

" I feel that I owe an apology for the grievous 
thoughts that in some way have been deemed to 
have had their origin in me. I have this much 
to say. Spirit-life has taught many lessons. I 
know that my life was so obscured that I was not 
known really as I was. I am not now known as 
I am. When, in the olden days, I would have 
thrown the battle axe, I now strive to throw over 
all a true mantle of charity. I have never, in full, 
revealed the mystery that encircled my last days. ’ 
I have no desire to do so; but I do say that to 
throw overall that humanity offers,'of so-called 
sin, a veil of charity, is a duty that only those well 
versed in the observation of a rule that is beauti­
ful, can know. Brother, I take you by the band. 
I say to you that though men may differ in some 
ofthe non-essentials, the whole heart and soul is, 
I believe, fixed upon the truth. I will.not refer 
particularly to the way my old paper is run, I 
hope. In some instances there has been wrong 
doing. I can hate the sin, and love what is left 
that is pure of the sinner. Brother, be of good 
cheer! I have a love for trulli that I had not then. 
I see (be clouds over all, but Ibey are breaking, 
and I hope, above all things, that fhore will come 
a lime that will break down this great barrier be­
tween right and wrong, and unity of feeling be­
come one of the essentials of life. 8.8. Jones:'

V^/host cordially reciprocate the kindly sug­
gestions of the spirit of our brother, and trust that 
we may be permitted, hereafter, to substitute tho 
veil of charity for the mace of justice. We want 
peace. It is for tbo conductors ol' th^ fl.-P. Journal 
to say whether it shall be peace or aYenewal of 
war. Never will they find ns in a more favorable

spared, we claim no merit of prophecy, when we 
say a new order of things will follow in American i 
a^irs. Guiteau was but the,instrument of ma- i 
lign and reactionary spirit influences, when lie I 
planned and executed that attempt at the de- i 
Struction of the life of the great mediumistic i 
leader of American progress. This fact will be- : 
come certainly and generally known as time pro­
gresses. In order to show that we do not theo­
rize in this matter, but follow the light of facts, 
we will call your attention, dear reader, to the 
following facts, as they were currently reported 
in the public prints. '

After weeks of such a struggle for life as has been 
of the rarest occurrence, and the gradual exhaus­
tion of his vital powers to a degree surpassing a 
reasonable hope of recovery, a new complication 
ensues, that drives his medical attendants to de­
spair ; they inform his noble, brave and devoted 
wife, that all grounds of hope have been lost, and 
his children are summoned to his bed side. The 
gloom of a nation’s sorrow hangs over and around 
that couch of suffering, and the indomitable hope 
of that faithful loving wife has reached its limit. 
At. such, a time, our townsman, the distinguished 
surgeon, is summoned more as a formality than 
with any hope of relief—he enters that sick 
chamber, approaching the executive patient, looks 
upon him with those sympathetic eyes, takes his 
hand, touches his emaciated form, and stands in 
deep and magnetic thought. Oh I .how anxiously I 
how tenderly! that wife looks.ou that meditative 
scene, all unconscious, of the unseen bands of 
spirit physicians that throng around their mor­
tal coadjutor. The council is ended, Dr. Agnew 
looks up, bis eyes meet those of Mrs. Garfield, 
soul reads soul, and the light of hope again beams 
forth from the face of each. From that moment 
the news, on the wings of the lightening, is 
flashed to every part of the country and over the 
world, that a most unexpected change.has taken 
place—the stomach, the powers of which had been 
entirely exhausted for weeks, has resumed the 
performance of i'ls functions—the President is 
eating nnd assimilating his food—the inflamed 
parotid gland that delied surgery, and threatened 
an early fatal.result, has.yielded to treatment— 
and a further lease of life has been the result.

Who that is conversant wilh spirit intercourse, 
and who has from experience learned to know 
the power that spirits can and do exert over the 
affairs of mortals, will question the intervention 
of spirits to save our President? • War were told, 
in the current public-reports, that Mrs. Garfield 
had regained her hopeful cheerfulness under the 
magical influence of Dr. Agnew's presence at the 
bedside of her husband, and from her loving soul 
one unbroken stream of magnetic vitality was 
projected, to rekindle the dying embers of the 
vital spark, upon which hang the hopesand inter­
ests of the nation and the world. Dr. Agnew js a 
natural physician, and his professional success is

Thine, .

mood for conciliation and concord.

A SPECIMEN OF BUNDYISM. v
Some three or four weeks ago we published a 

letler from Mrs, Dr. Abbie E. Cutter, of Wicket's 
Island, Ons?t Bay, heading it “A noble woman’s 
protest.” In it, Mrs. Cutter stated the fact that 
the managers of the Onset Bay Spiritualist Camp­
meeting had torn down the notices put.upon the 
general bulletin board announcing a public lecture 
by herself, and a public seance by Mrs. C. B. Bliss' 
at Wicket’s Island, also that tho management had 
made objection to tho binding of passengers from 
Wicket’s Island at the camp. We made no com­
ments upon this manifestation of petty opposition 
to Mrs. Cutter’s most commendable undertaking, 
but felt none tho less disgusted at it. Tho follow­
ing week the Onset Huy Dol, the organ of the On­
set Bay Camp-meeting managers, edited by E. ' 
Gerry Brown, Ihe former swindling publisher of 
a short-lived scurrilous publication, called The 
Spiritual Scientist, came out with a vile and malig- 
iiiinl attack upon our paper and ourself, which 
showed that they were conscious of having acted 
in a superlatively mean manner towards Mrs. 
Cutter. To soften their mortification, Brown' was 
directed to excuse, even if he could not justify 
their conduct, which only made their meanness 
so much.the more conspicuous. In-the hope that 
wc might shame thein into more reasonable con­
duct, we criticised their course in our next, with 
tlie following result. The leading article of Dol 
of August 20th, we here give. .

"An article one column and a half in length, 
small type, appeared in Mud and Mutter of Phil­
adelphia, which was presumably intended as a 
reply to our short notice of this nondescript 
weekly. As we have conscientious scruples against 
buying a copy of the sheet, wo are obliged to de­
pend upon onr memory of the article after read­
ing it, through the kindness of a friend who 

i loaned us a copy, We would give credit for this 
favor to Deacon Wealherliee, but as he seemed 
ashamed of having the abnormal Rliil! in bis pos­
session, and explained how he came to be so un­
fortunate, wc will forbear, Onr memory is not 
seriously taxed however. It was one of those 
demoniacal eflorts for which lloberls is famous, 
where he permits his favorite control‘darkness’

not less dependent on that fact, than on his ac- i 
knowledged mental talents, experience and skill. 
Mrs. Garfield is a medium, and no one is so fit to 
be the nurse of the spirit chosen medium, for this 
nation, as herself. Spirits and angels bless her— 
be with her in those tender vigils—pour upon her 
your beneficent influence, that she may imparl it 
to her beloved sufferer, and save him, to complete 
the grand mission he was called to fill. Spirit- 
ualisls, mediums, invoke the united power of the 
spirit hosts of light, in this hour of mortal peril 
and need,. We know they can, and will come, if 
the way is opened for them, ti proper manifesta­
tion of a strong desire for, and due appreciation 
of their mighty help being the prerequisites.

In so far as the foregoing communication relates 
lo the opposition that is being organized to de­
stroy Mino and Matter, we feel no concern ; for 
so long us il continues to be u true, a faithful and 
fearless friend of Truth, we know that no powers 
however dark or mighty, can effect its deslrnc- 
■tion; when it fails to be that, weVill be the first 
to execute justice upon il, anil strike it its death­
blow. Mini) and* Matter was not born to die. 
Should we fall ut its helm, wo know that there 
uro brave hearts and brawny arms to take our 
place, and keep her afloat until no longer needed 
to bear aloft, to every land where breathes a hu­
man soul, the standard emblem of truth, purity 
and freedom. Horace Greeley said that his last 
desire would be, that above his grave should be 
inscribed, "Founder of the New York Tribune.” 
More humble than he, we ask only that in the 
memory of our readers nftiy linger a recollection 
of us, as having tried lo do our duly lo mortalsand 
spirits.

At a silling wilh Mrs. Carrie E. Twing, at Lake 
Pleasant Camp-meeting, on the 18lh of August, wc 
received moil unexpectedly Ihe following com- 
inuuication. Il was written mechanically through 
the hand of the medium while she was fully en­
gaged in conversation with ns on subjects entirely

I’. S.—Danner of Light please copy. 
. ' ' G. W.

Such was the communication sent to us by Dr/ 
G. Amos Pierce, of Lewiston, Maine. It wiis 
written prior to August 24th, and reached us only 
on Saturday the 27th of August. At the time 
that communication was given, Dr. Pierce could 
have had no personal knowledge of the crisis that 
was approaching in the case of President Garfield, 
and the near approach to dissolution that he has 
passed through within the past four days, and out 
of which he seems to beemerging as if by miracu­
lous help. That the spirit of General George 
Washington, is at the head of an association of 
spirits, known in spirit life as the SpiriFCoiigress, 
we have many times had the most positive assu­
rance, through the communications of returning 
spirits. That congress is largely composed of the 
spirits of American statesmen, whose solicitude 
for the welfare of the American people has been 
intensified by their spirit realizations of tho mo­
mentous influence for good, that has been the 
outcome of their earthly labors in founding and 
successfully conducting the. aflairs bf the young 
American Republic, We can well understand 
how intense is their anxiety for the recovery of 
President Garfield, and tho might of the spirit 
power that they will put forth to save him. Oh! 
if tho world only realized the actual power of 
spirits, to successfully intervene to prevent vast 
human calamities, not thus long would that great 
hearted, kind and able public servant, have lan­
guished belweenjije and death. Thank Eternal 
Goodness there are mediums, in that national 
household, President Garfield himself, not the 
least sensitive among them. This was shown by 
the apparently sponlaiieous recognition of his pre­
eminent fitness for tlie most responsible position 
that any person was ever called to fill, in a con­
vention, the members of which had no thought of 
him. when they assembled, nor for days after they 
began their deliberation. His nomination and 
election were not the Result of a happy chance, 
but the effect of spirit influences, exerted as never 
before, to take the control of our national affairs 
out of the hands of trading politicians, and place 
it in the hands of men, who were susceptible to 
the high and unselfish influences of beneficent 
spirits, If the life and health of the President are

to indite his editorials. It was wholly vitupera­
tive. Whatever he may say of us personally is of 
little moment, and serves to amuse us greatly, 
that is, if we have time to read il. In days gone ■ 
by we occasionally wrote a paragraph of a few 
lines, and jt invariably threw him into a war 
dance that evolved a column article at least. If 
he hail listened to our advice several years ago, he . 
Would not be in his present pit iabie condition. 
Roberts once owned a hllle farm in New Jersey, 
where he managed lo gel a comfortable and easy 
living, loan evil day he was thrown iiilo com- 
•pany of individuals who kept a factory for pro­

, during character artists who called their efforts 
foreign to it. We had made no mention.of Mr. j1 materialization.’ Roberts wrote laudatory arli- 
Llncoln or the President and was not thinking of; ' '1‘'3 nn'' 10Ped the people info the show. When 

° ! an exposure came on, and the case was tried in
court, Ihe government attorney could not elicit > 
the information from Roberts, whether he was or 
was not financially interested in the so-called, 
medium. It was a most disgraceful case, and the 
evidence against the whole crew was disgusting. 
Soon nfler this he started his paper, familiarly 
known as Mud and Mutter, for the reason that he ■ 
throws Mud at anyone who does not respond to 
his Muller. . His line of business is to take adver­
tisements from any fraud who may announce 
himself or herself to be a medium for the trance, 
medical or any.other phase of mediumship. The . 
Spiritualistic press refuse charlatans, so far as . 
they can determine them to be such, allhoiigh 
the methods of one are more severe than another;

them at the time, • .
"The hattie is not to the strong-alone. Look I 

for new results. The ‘Shadow of Death,'as you 
call il, is over the White House. Keep this and re­
member that a name, even the name of‘Stalwart,’ 
cannot elwk all things. O, nation, beware! Yon 
.are weaving your own shroud unless you can so 
divide yourselves from all enemies of Truth that 
right shall be triumphant. There is not much to 
be said. The nation’s interests are in the balance. 
'Brave men to the rescue! Trust not that which 
trembles and turns pale at the thought of assuming 
a sentinel'sjjosition. Blood has been shed. Keep 
this; and tyuteh the signs of the times. I watch, 
work, and wait. Aubaham Lincoln.,
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but Roberts takes everything. The result is, 
these quacks pool into the ring to help their or­
gan out. They will announce a sitting free for 
any one who subscribes for the paper; but the 
public are not told how much they pay for the 
advertisement, or what the proportion of the 
4 divy ’ is between the proprietor, the quack and 
the dupe. It is a natural consequence that such 
a paper should regard itself as doing a ‘ mission,’ 
inasmuch as the admission is always in advance, 
and also that it is a messenger of the spirit world. 
To have the abuse of such a sheet, is decidedly 
more creditable than .its friendly notes. When 
it speaks of a noble woman, the reader may be 
sure that either the woman or the editor lias a 
‘mouse in the meal;’ on the contrary, when it 
denounces in abusive Billingsgate, an individual 
or- an association, it is strong proof they are ad­
vancing Spiritualism, protecting and fostering 
true mediumship, and making whatever sacrifice 
is within their power to shed light sufficiently 
strong to completely shade the dark slums of sen­
suality similar to those in which the editor of 
Mud and Mutter and his admirers grovel in their 
slime of unprogressed influences. Letters which 
he has written and are now preserved, are evi­
dences which have not been used against him, 
and he may thank the charity of those who per­
mit him this freedom of action. As we have said 
before, he has no influence except among the 
same order as that to which ho lias descended. 
We therefore welcome his attacks as among the 
strongest endorsements we have yet had of the 
efficiency of our course of treatment of him."

We might be excused if we entirely overlooked 
this vile and wholly untruthful attack upon us, by 
the Bundyito managers at Onset Bay, so far as 
any personal consequences are concerned, but the 
interests of truth demand that we shall fasten 
upon them the full responsibility ofthe mendacity 
of their organ, and this we proceed to do. There 
is no such paper in Philadelphia as “Mud and 
Mutter,” “nondescript" or otherwise. Falsehood 
No, 1. Roberts never owned a little farm in New 
Jersey. Falsehood No. 2. In no day, "evil” or 
otherwise, was .he thrown in company with dis­
reputable people “who kept a factory for produc­
ing character artists who called their efforts ‘ma­
terialization.”' Falsehood No. 3. Roberts never 
“roped" any person intoany “show.” Falsehood 
No. 4. No exposure ever came on, in which the 
question of our pecuniary involvement was raised, 
in court or anywhere else. Falsehood No. 5, and 
as black a lie as ever was conceived or penned. 
Nothing disgraceful was ever fastened upon us, or, 
upon any person associated with us in any way. 
Falsehood No.G. We never started a paper known 
“familiarly,” or any other way, as Mud and Mut­
ter. Falsehood No. 7. We never threw mud at 
anyone for not giving us an “approving nod." 
Falsehood No. 8. It is not onr business to take 
advertisements from frauds, mediums or others. 
Falsehood No. 9. Roberts does not take every­
thing or anything of that kind. Falsehood No. 10. 
No quacks “pool into the ring to help us out." 
FalsehoodNo.il. The allegation that the medi- 

-ums who voluntarily tender their services lo con­
tribute towards extending our circulation are 
quacks, is baselessly false, unless all mediums 
through whom the Hpirit-world communicate and 
manifest are quacks, and this no true and honest 
Hpirilualisl would allege. Falsehood No. 12. The 
insinuation that there is any deception or misrep­
resentation on the part of those mediums or our­
self, is unworthy of any other than a heartlessly 
dishonest person. Falsehood No. 13.

We sincerely trust that never again will Spirit- 
ulism be begrimed and disgraced by professions of 
friendship mi the part of those who have used it 
to speculate upon it, as the leading managerfl of 
tho Onset Bay Association have done in the past. 
Selfishness and mercenary greed can have no 
proper place in Spiritualism, which has been 
given to the world without price and without 
stint, by beneficent spirits. We do not think it is 
too late to purge theOnsetBay managemontof all 
the moral obliquity now connected with it, and 
trust that another election will suffice to bring that 
much to-be-desired result about. Let them sei; 
that that Dot is blotted out, or the unfortunate 
journalistic swindler, E. Gerry Brown, deprived 
of that avenue of ventilating his reeking moral 
corruption tothe mortification of all sincere Spirit­
ualists. We would like to speak well of any 
movement that is capable of being made useful in 
tho work of advancing Spiritualism, but the Onset 
Bay Grove Association, under its present manage­
ment, can never become so.-Il is too bad that the 
time Spiritualists who imagined that they were 
helping Spiritualism by investing their means so 
freely us they have done at that naturally beauti­
ful spot, should have had tlieir good intentions so 
largely defeated by the unwortbiness of those to 
whom they looked for some honest effort to pro­
mote Spiritualism. We have no doubt that, there 
are, some well-meaning persons in the Board of 
Managers, but they allow themselves to be over­
ruled by others who should be made to take a 
back seat. We intend to visit Onset Bay next 
year, and hope then to find in control, at that 
place, those from whom we will have the right to 
look for some manifestation of propriety and good 
sense.

Spiritual Census Statistics.--Having been 
called upon by officials of the Census Bureau for 
all statistics within our reach, in regard to the 
Spiritualist societies and organization, we would 
call the attention of all our readers to the impor­
tance of furnishing whatever information they 
may have in that direction ; name and member­
ship of societies within their .knowledge, with 
names and addresses of officers of each. Any 'such 
information sent at once to this office will be 
duly forwarded tothe proper census authorities.

“THE SPIRITUAL OFFERINfi.”
We are in receipt of the first number of " The 

Spiritual Offering, bearing date the fid of Septem­
ber,which we welcometothefieldofspiritual jour­
nalism with feelings of the heartiest cordiality. 
The Offering in its new form promises to become a 
power in the spiritual movement, and hence the 
profound gratification we feel in welcoming it to 
the battle-field where truth is contending against 
its enemies, priestcraft, theological error, and 
time-honored superstitious formalism. As a 
monthly publication The Offering won golden 
opinions from its readers, and grew in popularity 
as it grew in circulation; and we will yield onr 
claims as a prophet, if, as a weekly publication, it 
does not become the representative spiritual paper 
of the Great West. At its head are two as earn­
est, thorough-going, eloquent, and able Spiritual­
ists as can anywhere be found., and who will ever 
be seen in the foremost front of the great move­
ment of human progress inaugurated by benefi­
cent spirits thirty-three years ago, to emancipate 
the human mind from the thraldom of selfishness, 
ignorance and superstition—the representative 
trinity or theological triumvirate, governing at 
present the theological, ethical and social polity 
of the world. No “carpet knights" are they, but 
grim-visaged warriors who have staked their all 
on the sacredness .and rightfulness of the cause 
they espouse and the certainty of Its growth and 
ultimate triumph. *x

Among the contents of the first number, the 
whole of which are valuable, are (he following 
aYticles: " The Resurrection, rationally and spir­
itually considered, or how we will know our 
friends hereafter;” a “Lecture, delivered by W. 
J. Colville under tho influence of his spirit guides, 
al Republican Hall, New York City;” a “ Letter ! 
from the veteran Spiritualist and writer, Thomas ; 
R. Hazard, on tho suggestion of S. B. Nichols, of 
Brooklyn, N. Y., to raise ten thousand dollars to 
defray the expenses of the editor-at-largo bureau 
for the coming year. Mr. Hazard protests most 
emphatically againsttho assumptions of Mr. Nich­
ols. a*to the utility and inlhieneo of that bizarre 
institution, us we think, most justly and properly. 
Mr. Hazard says: .

“There is no question that Mr. Brittan has a 
perfect right to enjoy his private, o anions (though 
they conflict with all the facts of I io universe) on 
one and every subject; but us lis friend, Mr. 
Nichols, observes in another connection, ‘there 
is no need of argument’ to show the terrible in­
justice (amounting to the ‘ poetic ’) that would bo 
‘perpetrated by Spiritualists, should they bestow 
on the ‘editor-at-large’ ten thousand dollars for 
a service claimed to have been done by him to 
their cause, which, in fact, has been accomplished 
solely by angelic hosts manifesting their benefi­
cent powers through humble instruments, that 
he, their defamor, has, with some of his friends, 
done everything in their power to crush out of 
existence. Thus history would repeat itself. Tho 
murderers of Jesus, the great materializing me- 
diuni of old, divided his garments among them. 
The would-be murderers of tho 'materializing 
mediums’ of our day would bestow on ono of 
their number a hundred times the value of all the 
garments their poor murdered victims ever pos­
sessed."

As1 a matter of course, not being a Christian 
Spiritualist, wo cannot subscribe to Mr. Hazard's 
trenchant Spiritualistic. Christian simile. We do 
not think, with all his idio-vncrancies that. Dr. 
Brittan would murder any one, not.even his 
'imaginary rivals for spiritual distinction, the‘ma­
terializing mediums.’ But then, Mr. Hazard did 
not mean that, he only intended to.be understood 
as using a Christian metaphor, which in all con­
science is bloody enough to suit the predilec­
tions of Captain Kid or the Pirate Briggs.

The editorial greeting of tho editors, outlines 
very clearly the policy Unit will bo observed in 
their‘management of The Offering. Wo in the 
main concur in the sentiments expressed in 
their greeting, bfit think -they will find there will 
have to be a good deal of iconoclastic work, or 
root grubbing, done before the field will bo large 
enough to admit of the sowing of the full crop of 
truth that beneiieentspirits have come to earth to 
plant, the harvesting of which will bless the 
whole human race. . .

Hour.friends of tho Offering prefer to collect 
and burn the rootlings that still impede Ilie har­
row of criticism, all right, they can do a good and 
useful work in that way. We will continue to do 
tho heavy grubbing, and will find the bottom of 
the sturdiest lap root of error, and sledge away 
the massive holders that now cumber the surface 
of Truth’s domain. Some how, as onr muscles 
grow harder, and stand out Ijke cords of steel, we 
begin to think.ohl Hercules,,from spirit life, has 
chosen and tilled us, for the performance of the 
twelve fabulous labors .which have been attri­
buted to him. We are, already engaged in clean­
ing onLan institution even more formidable Ilian 
the cleansing of the stable of Augeas, King of 
Elis, which housed three thousand head of cattle, 
and had not been cleaned in thirty years. 
Whether we shall accomplish our task in so short 
a time, comparatively, as one day, as did Hercules 
his, we know not, nor care not. This we know, 
that we have turned the resistless and cleansing 
stream of truth through it, and it will be cleansed, 

■ The editorial reply of The Offering, tn the in­
vidious find uncharitable attempt of the great 
light of MethodistChristianity, Dr. J, P. Newman, 
to disparage Mode/m’(Spiritualism, is searching 
and. scathing in the extreme, and shows that there 
are blows to be given in defence and on behalf of 
truth, that will teach its Christian enemies a les­
son of prudence, if not liberality and toleration.

The first chapter of the serial story, from the 
spirit inspired pen of Mrs. Nettie Pease Fox, en­
titled "Mysteries of the Border Land; or, The 
Unconscious Side of Conscious Life,” is very 
interesting, and cannot but hold the attention 

,of the reader to the end of the last chapter. ( 
■ The editorial on “Sectarianism in Spiritualism” 
leaves no doubt as to the position The Offering 
will take on that question.. It says:

“Within the past few years, noticeably since 
1875, a movement has been inaugurated well cal­
culated, whether intended or not, to build up a 
great wall, separating Spiritualists into'two classes. 
This movement comes from the earth, not from 
the skies. We care not to inquire as to the mo­
tives of men; they may be sincere, but sincerity 
is not the question; is it right, is it for the good 
of humanity, is it calculated to advance the cause 
inaugurated by the spirits thirty-three years ago? 
Every true Spiritualist will ask these’ questions 
before deciding to give favor to any movement 
prepared by man. The attempt to add the prefix 
(Christian’ to Spiritualism is already producing 
the effect so much dreaded, of introducing sectari­
anism, the curse of the world, among a people 
who we had hoped had grown too. large to ac­
cept of it. Many having just escaped from spirit­
ual bondage are wide awake enough to prevent 
the weaving around them again of a cord, how­
ever finely silvered, that .may grow and become a 
chain of servitude. * * *

" With our present light, we are as strongly 
opposed to this movement as it is possible to be. 
We have no objection to the good brother’s (A 
Spiritualist Correspondent) acclamation of praise 
to ‘Jesus of Nazareth,’ when mentioning his 
name, or his alluding to him as the ‘ Great Teach­
er;' let him do so to his heart’s content;'but 
when the attempt is made to introduce his wor­
ship, under devotion (‘ blessed be his name for­
ever’) into Spiritualism, the subject calls for onr 
most emphatic protest, and to it The Offering will 
stand an'uncompromising opponent."

On the question of the union of religion and 
polities, church and state, the most reactionary 
and accursed policy that was ever advocated in a 
country consecrated to human freedom, The Offer­
ing H^nds forth no uncertain sounds. Spiritualism 
and mental freedom are tho synonyms of-each 
other.

That spiritual metal has the right ring. It is 
pure gold and nothing else. Timo and space will 
not allow ns to say more at this time, than that 
we extend to onr Western contemporary,’ tho 
right hand of fellowship and good will.

Spiritualists, rally around The Spiritual Offering, 
and give it yo.ur most generous support. It is 
worthy of your confidence, and will repay many 
fold, all that you may do in its behalf.

-----------------^«, ^.-----------------

EDITORIAL BRIEFS.

The Connecticut Spiritualist Camp-meeting com­
menced Aug, 17 and will close Sept. 14. •

A. Rothkiimel informs us that Ito will bo in 
Brooklyn after September 8th, when ho will bo 
ready to make engagements for tho fall and win­
ter. He will go from Lake Pleasant to Lake 
George, and so on homo. .

A Materializing Medium Wanted.—Edwin 
Bishop, of Leslie, Inghnm county, Mich., writes: 
" Wo want a good materializing medium, many 
stand ready to receive the truth if they can have 
the testimony. If any such medium should come 
this way wo hope they will give us a call.

SruscHiiiEiis writing to us to change tho address 
of their paper must state,their last address as well 
as the address they wish it changed to. Simply 
siiying, " Change address of iyy paper,” puts us to 
great inconvenience and trouble, which can easily 
be avoided by giving the present address. '

Manchester, N. II., Juno 27,1881 —Tho Spirit­
ualist Society holdpublic circles every Sunday at 
6.3(1 I’.M., in their hall, No. 14 Opera House Block, 
Hanover street; lectures commencing September 
11th. Asa Emory, President; Jos. Freschi, Vico 
President; G. F. Rumrill, Secretary,

A. F, Ackkhly, tho youngest materializing me- 
ilium in Ihe world, is now located at No. 1128 Vino 
street, Philadelphia, until October 1st, where ho 

। will hold seances every evening; on Tuesdays, 
j Thursdays and Sundays for full form matcrializa- 
| lions, and on tho remaining evenings'for physical 
| manifestation's. Private seances on reasonable 
terms: also developing circles.

Tur Northern Wisconsin Spiritual Conference 
j will hold a three day's meeting in Spiritual Hull, 
| (imro, September I), 10 and 11. The speakers are 
James Ray Applebee,,of Chicago; T. 0. Willey, of 
Madison, and others. We extend an invitation 
to all lo participate, regardless of belief, assuring 

( them of courteous treatment. As we 'maintain a 
i free platform,all are iiiyited to speak their honest 

convictions. All will bo entertained free as far as 
possible. Wm. M. Lockwood, president,'and Dr, 

i J. C. Phillips, secretary.

Mas. Patithson, tho very remarkable inde­
pendent slate-writing medium, from Pittsburg, 

, Pa., niter a successful and convincing exhibition 
of her gift at the late camp at Neshaminy Grove, 
L now located at. No, 421 Hartman sheet, Camden, 
N. J., where she will give private sittings for slate 
writing tests, or will make engagements to attend 
small parties at other places, In her peculiar 
phase of slate-writing, a small piece of pencil is 
placed between two slates, which arc locked to­
gether, or screwed and sealed, if the party asking 
(lie question so chooses; and when the question 
is answered, or the message given, the pencil ap­
pears outside of the slate. Sometimes a flower or 
other article will be found between tho slates 
when opened.

The Communications from Ancient Spirits 
through the mediumship of Alfred James.—A 
desire having been expressed by several of our 
correspondents to have the communications pur­
porting to come from ancient spirits, bearing 
upon the subject of the origin and truth of the 
Christian religion—as published from time to 
time in Mind and Matter—in aconsecutive shape 
for convenient reference, we would state that it 
has been our fixed intention to collect these com­
munications and arrange .them in book form, 
together with our own comments thereon, and 
such confirmative or corroborate information, 
as we may obtain in the course of our researches 
in the same direction, This will probably make 
a volume of some 400 to 450 pages, and will there­
fore be an undertaking, involving much labor and 
considerable risk, and it would encourage us in 
the work, if those of our friends who have any 
desire to possess the work when completed, would 
notify us of such desire—that we may judge about 
how far we may expect to be-sustained in our 
efforts to arrive at tho truth in regard to a subject 
of so much importance to humanity. ,

The Spiritual Offering.—We invite the special 
attention of our readers to the announcement, in 
another column, of the resumption of the publi­
cation of tho Spiritual Offering as an eight-page 
weekly journal, It will be published regularly at 
Newton, Iowa. , The first number will be issued 
on August 15th, when a largo edition will bo sent 
out for inspection. Wo cannot now do more than 
express our sincere gratification to know that 
the Offering is to be continued, and especially 
that it is to bo a weekly instead of a monthly 
publication. Since tho suspension of the Offering, 
wo have been favored by a personal acquaintance 
with Mr, and Mrs. D, M, Fox, and feel confident 
that they are just tho persons to conduct a live, 
entertaining and instructive weekly Spiritual 
journal. They aro both earnest and talented 
Spiritualists, and Mrs. Nettie Ponse Fox being a 
medium ofthe most accutoly sensitive nature, the 
spirit world, through her, will have much that is 
important to impart. Wo welcome the announce­
ment of tho resumption of tho publication of the 
Spiritual offering, and urge our friends to give the 
undertaking all possible encouragement. By an 
arrangement made with the editor and publisher 
ofthe Spiritual Offering, for $250, both papers will 
bo sent to any subscriber for ono year. They can 
bo ordered at either office.

■ --------_^ ^^ +— --------------- •

Frank T. Ripley.
J. A. Shephard writes us from Gtirnoo, Ill., that 

“the celebrated tost medium and speaker, Frank 
T. Riploy, spoke, and gave somo of those excellent 
tests at Whittier flail on Sunday last. Tho tests 
wore especially interesting, as there were more 
than a usual number of skeptics present. Ono in 
particular I will mention: A prominent Spiritual­
ist invited a skeptic friend to comoand hear Mr. 
Ripley, but tho skeptic replied that 2 this public 
test business was a d—d humbug; all made up 
before hand, Ac., Ac." Through curiosity, how­
ever, ho came, and tho sequel will show how ho 
came, he mu\ and icmi conquered. It happened 
that ho came in very late; Mr. Ripley was giving 
a test to a buly near tho platform. As the skeptic 
stepped into tho door, ho said, “ Stop a moment, I 
wish to speak to that gentleman just coming in: a 
spirit, Ac.,” (going on and giving a full descrip­
tion). “What do you know about it?" Tho 
skeptic was much embarrassed and made no ro-< 
ply. Mr. R. then said, " Sir, aro yon willing to 
luivo mo go on and tell what Ido seo?" The 
skeptic answered “ Yes, sir.” Air. R. then pro- 
cebdod to describe another spirit,’giving a full 
description, with ago and name; ending by say­
ing, "Now, sir, am I correct, do you know these 
spirits?” The skeptic, replied that ho did. Mr. 
IL then said, “There is a man in tho audience 
who says thoso tests are all a humbug, and fixed 
up beforehand; will yon please tell tho audience 
whether wo over mot before ? ’’ Ho replied, " We 
have nover mot before.” After tho meeting ho 
came to Mr. R,. and acknowledged that he had 
used tho identical words, “all humbug, fixed up 
beforehand, Ac.” Altogether it was ono of tho 
best public tests I over listened to, ’

Mr. Ripley will probably stay with us for several 
weeks, as there scums to bo quite a demand for Lis 
mediumistic powers.”

Acknowledgment.
Vineland, N. J., Aug. 13, 1881.

Editor of Mind and Matter:
Please acknowledge through your paper the re­

ceipt by us ofthe following donations, in response 
to onr appeal, and tonderyo tho generous friends 
who have so kindly remembered us in our pres­
ent distress with substantial tokens of their re­
gard, onr sincere gratitude and ..heartfelt thanks 
for their kindness. Although wo have become 
reconciled to tho impending calamity of losing 
our home, yet wo feel deeply grateful to those who 
have so generously responded to our call.

Tims, R. Hazard, $20 00
Luther Dolby, 10 00
Received through Hanner, .. 5 00
Airs. Al. A. Alanly, ... 1 00
Charles Fix, ' ' 1 00
Phebe Cross, 1 00
Alrs.'Ann Smith, 1 00
Thos. Atkinson, 1 00
D. S. Kimball, AL D., 1 00

Total, $41 00

Alfred James’ Relief Fund.
In response to our appeal in behalf of Alfred 

James, we take pleasure in acknowledging that 
wo have received Ihe following amounts from the 
respective contributors:
Previously .acknowledged $150 08
F, 8. Davis, Princeton, Iowa, 1 00-
E. Sexton, Nederland, Colorado, 2 00
Ira Allis, Wellington, Ohio, 1 00

FalsehoodNo.il
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PAPA IS COMING HOME.

[selected.]

Five little noses against the pane.
Five pairs of eyes peering down the lane, 
Trying to see thro’ the mist and rain 

If papa is coming home.

The clock on the mantle has Just struck four, 
Which teds they’ve to wait one half hour more 
Before the train, with its rattle and roar, 

’ WiU bring their papa home.

; Five little feces clean and sweet, 
Dimpled Angers and dancing feet, 
Well-brushed Jackets and aprons neat, 

For papa is coming home;

Over the track, with ita light so bright, 
Tbe long train glides in ita rapid Right, 
And Ave little children are happy to-night, 

For papa is coming home.

The whistle sounds, the gate's a-swing, 
Footsteps clatter and voices ring, 
Bed lipa kiss and white arms cling, 

n For papa has come home.
1 • —Tin Guiding Star.

The Giant and the Missing Children.

A FAIRY STORY.

‘ Did our young readers ever hear the German 
story of “The Giant and the Missing Children ? ” 
It tells what happened a long time ago in a vil­
lage among the mountains. One summer there 
the children began to disappear one by one. It 
was certain that they were not kidnapped, and it 
was just as sure that they did not run away. The 
first that vanished was little Hans Stobbelt.

“Has anybody seen my Hans?” cried his 
grandma, standing outside of the door of her cot­
tage. “ I had just told him I wanted him to go to 
the miller’s, and he has disappeared, somehow 
all at once, without knowing what the errand is. 
Hans! where are you?” phe shouted. " Why, he 
was here not half a minute ago!” ’

But nene of the neighbors could tell anything 
of Hans. What is more, Hans did not reappear. 
The night passed, and he did not come; the next 
morning, nothing was to be seen of- him. All the. 
villagers were much excited; for, though Hans 
had not been a good boy, everbody was sorry at 
this having happened to him. While a group of 
them round about the grandmother were pitying 
her, a cry arose in one of the other cottages. 
Those who hurried from there found Frau Hick- 
elt standing-near the hearth, with her hands 
raised, gazing vacantly before her.

“My Gretchen is gone!” she said in a fright­
ened voice. “I just bid her clean the hearth, and 
when I looked again she was not there. Where 
is.she gone? she asked, turning from .one to an­
other of them. In fact, they thought Frau Hick- 
elt had gone mad. But it was quite true that 
Gretchen could not be found, though they looked 
everywhere for her, both indoors and out.

That day three other children vanished. On the 
next day five went. All the village was in alarm; 
that is. the elders were, for they tried to keep it 
from the children themselves. There was no cer­
tainty about any boy or girl in that place. The 
grown-up people had but to turn their backs, and 
he or she was gone in an instant. .

At last a strange clew was got to the mystery. 
Little Augusta Hirsch vanished when her aunt, as 
well as her mother, was in the kitchen.

The aunt said: "I saw her go! At her mother’s 
bidding she had just taken the broom lo sweep 
behind the stove, when fill at once she disap­
peared, just as she was speakinu the words, * I 

' wish—’ But she hadn’t time to 'finish. I heard 
nothing more. She was gone like a flash!”

“That is very strange!” exclaimed grandma 
7 Stobbelt, who was one of the listeners. “Now 

you speak of it, the last words I heard my Hans 
say behind my back were, ‘ I wish—’ ” "

/ “Those very words my Gretchen said!” cried 
c Frau Hickelt.

Indeed, nearly everybody who had lost a child 
came forward, and each and all were able to con­
firm'this. Two things could be made out—first, 
that the children only went when their elders 
had set them to do some task; second, that in the 
act of vanishing they all uttered the words,- “ I 
wish—”, But in about a week’s time the tiling 
was carried yet a step farther. . '

“ My Gustave is gone! ” cried Wilhelm Neu­
mark, appearing excitedly at the gate of his.gar- 
den. "My ears are quick,” he added, as the 
neighbors gathered arqund; “ and I clearly heard 
all the words he said. I had bid him dig faster, 
and he answered, “ I wish there was no digging!”

“ Why, our Hans did not want to go to the mi 1- 
ler’s,’”grandma:8.tobbelt hastened to say.

. “Nor,”cried Frau Hickelt, did my Gretchen 
like to dust up the hearth.” '

" It is so I ” solemnly said Wilhelm Neumark. 
“ They are taken away for being discontented at 
there being any work to do in life. They want it 
all play.

All the hearers grew more afraid on hearing 
this, and looked one at another. Scarcely a 
minute passed before a woman in the group said,

“What great shape is that I see upon the 
mountain yonder?” ....

Every head turned towards the Eahle Cliff, as 
it was called. It was a lofty rock some distance 
from the village, but looking right down the val­
ley towards it. The distance was too great for 
things on the rock to be clearly made out, but the 
woman declared she uld see the figure of a 

he said he was clothed in agiant sitting there.
. mantle, half bloKnback by the wind, and that he 

wore a hood oi/his head. No sooner did she say 
this than several others saw it all. Then two or  
three voices ciiied out together.

“ See, he is lifting his right arm and beckoning.”
At that instant a cry sounded from one of the 

houses. They knew it meant that a child had 
vanished. While they were looking in amaze­
ment, the giant again raised his arm beckoningly. 
as he did so, there came a fresh cry—another child 
had been taken. The whole thing was now plain 
—the children- disappeared whenever the giant 
on hearing their complaining wishes, signal’d for 
them. ■

The next morning his huge shape could be seen 
more distinctly sitting’on the rock, and whenever 
he beckoned, a child' went. The white-haired 
Lutheran minister, just as the sun was setting, 
came in front of tne crowd and said,

“ Let us each to-night by our bed-side pray that 
the children may be forgiyen and restored to us.”

This prayer was answered. Early the next 
morning, some who Were watching raised a cry, 

■ saying that the children were coming back. In a 
long procession, the little people were seen wind­
ingdown the valley. Their fathers and mothers 
and all the inhabitants ran to meeMhem. They 
were astonished' to see how meek tbe returning 
children were. .

*'Oh, let us get back to our work in helping 
you!” cried out a hubbub of boys' and girls’ 
voices.

No sooner had they neared the houses than the 
boys ran into the gardens, and, snatching up 
spades, began to dig; while the girls, darting into 
;he dwellings, instantly were sweeping, dusting, 
and polishing.

The explanation they all gave was this: “ While 
we were kept inside the mountain we were not 
allowed to do anything at all, and oh, it was so 
hard! The .good giant said we could not have 
play without work also.”

All looked toward the rock, but the figure of 
tbe giant was no longer to be seen. The boys and 
girls were much better for his visit.—Children’s, 
Friend.

Lake Pleasant Notes.
Lake Pleasant, Aug. 29, 1881.

Editor of Mind and Matter: -
This last week has been one of the most satis­

factory to mediums, all of them succeeding in 
doing a fair business. Investigators in the mater- 
ilizing phase, largely in the majority; all of those 
seances being crowded nightly. Physical mani- 
iestations, of which Rothermel and Davenport 
are the principal mediums, do not seem to attract 
much attention, which is likewise the,case with 
test circles.''Private sittings are more in demand 
with good mediums, but the time is so limited, 
being occupied with lectures and conferences, that 
the mediums cannot crowd all their sittings into 
the intervening time, therefore are obliged to 
send many away. ‘

We hope the next season that the meetings will 
be so conducted as to afford ample time to both 
lecturers and mediums, thereby giving investiga­
tors an opportunity of witnessing the phenomena, 
as well as listening to the philosophy of Spirit­
ualism.
, It has never been my fortune before, (good or 
bad, which ever you choose to term it), to listen 
to so many lecturers and would be lecturers, as at 
this season at the Lake. Exponents of the spirit­
ual philosophy, from their own standpoint, and 
who have mastered the mysteries of Spiritualism, 
and who claim to know just how the spirit world 
runs this material one, are here in abundance; 
and I think it would be well for all anxious in­
quirers to forward all their questions to the 
Lake, before the meeting adjourns, otherwise 
they will be sadly deficient when they reach the 
'‘shiningshore” in spiritual knowledge.

Yesterday being a fine day, and Sunday, brought 
an immense throng of visitors, many of whom 
were anxious inquirers into Spiritualism, and 
seemed pleased with their success among mediums.

Fanny D. Smith, of Brandon, Vermont, lectured 
inthe morning; J.'F. Baxter in the afternoon, 
followed by tests of a Satisfactory nature to the 
audience. There was a handsome illumination of 
the grounds on Saturday evening. I think it was 
the finest display we have had yet. -

Harvey Lyman, the oldest Spiritualist belonging 
to this association, and wife were serenaded on 
Friday evening, the occasion being that_ gentle­
man’s sixly-seventh birthday. Entertainments 
of various kinds are given in the hall nightly by 
elocutionists, psychologists, and those possessing 
musical talents.

As Mr. James and myself intend leaving the 
campon Wednesday morning,you will receive no 
further news from us until our return.

Yours for truth,
Mas. Alfred James.

' Special Notice from “Bliss’ Chief’s” Band.
VIK, Bed Cloud, speak for Bluckfopt. tlie great Medicine

Chief from happy hunting-grounds. Ho say ho love 
white-chiefe and squaws, Ho travel like the wind. Ho go 
to circles. Him big chief. Blackfoot want much work to 
do, Him want to siiow him healing power. Make sick 
pconle well. Where? paper go, Blackfoot go. Go quick. 
Send right away. '

All persons sick in body or mind that desire to 
be healed, also those that desire to be developed 
as spiritual mediums, will be furnished with 
Blackfoot’s Manetized Paper for 10 cents per 
sheet, 12 sheets $1.00, or 1 sheet each week.for 
one month for 40 cents, two months for 70 cents, 
three months, $1.00. Address James A. Bliss, 
713 Sansom street, Philadelphia, Pa. (Communi­
cations by mail, $1.00 and three 3-ct. stamps.)

Listof cures operated through and by Red Cloud 
and Blackfoot’s Manetizec Paper,’James A. Bliss, 
Medium: Asthma—Woman 67 years cured, time 
of sickness 3 years; man 60 years great deal bene-' 
fited, 2 years sick. Paralysis—Woman 24 years, 
cured, time of sickness 1 year. Stiffness in knee 
joints—Girl 8 years, under treatment, benefited a 
great deal, stilfnes b years. Falling of womb- 
Two women, 48 and 23 year years, cured where 
M. D.’s pronounced incurable. Pains in Back­
Man and woman, both cured, 23 and 24 years. 
Inflamation of kidneys with complications—Man 
58 years, ?most cured, where M. D.’s pronounced 
incurable. Fits—Child 3 years, all right. Heart 

‘disease—Woman 26 years (my sister-in-law) as 
said M. D.’s; Bhe has had the heart disease and 
could not hVe two weeks; very little medicine 
taken, only tincture of digitalis; she is a trance 
medium and is always resisting her spiritual 
guid.e; my belief is that it was a correction from 
her guides; great deal better and up for two 
weeks, time required per M. D.’s for her death. 
Spirit control—Woman 64 years (my aunt), very 
well.’Pain in thigh—Man 27 years, all right. 
Running up and down pain in abdomen—Woman 
25 years, with a paper on now and feels a great 
deal better. .

State of Louisiana, 1 
Parish of Pointe Coupee, j
I hereby certify that the within list of cures pf 

different sicknesses were done per the. Red Cloud 
and Blackfoot magnetized paper. #

Witness my official, signature this 9th day of 
April, A. D. 1881. Jos. F. Tounoir,

seal. N..P.

Plagiarism.
Editor of Mind, and Matter :

Your papef of July 16th lies before me, contain­
ing a long article by W. E. Coleman, in which that 
blundering literary lunatic assails me as “In­
quirer.” Do you think, Mn Editor, it was no 
part of your duty to tell both him and your read­
ers. that “ Inquirer ” is not Mr. Burr ? I have 
looked at all the late papers to see such a correc­
tion, but find it not. ^

Now, sir, I do not propose to make any repiy to 
this malicious assault, but I wish to say that I am 
about to publish a tract containing three articles, 
yclept Sermons, namely, first, “ Shame I Sham! 
Pshaw!” 2. “Dogs.” 3. “Cock-a-doodle-do.” The 
first two appeared in the Seymour Times; but the 
last and most important was rejected by the edi­
tor, after having allowed the literary coxcomb of 
Presidio, more than four times as much space as I 
had occupied.

My rejected article proves beyond all possible 
doubt, in the face of W. E. C.’b denial, that in his 
tract of 1879, entiled “Sabbath Observance,” he 
plagiarized from my pamphlet of 1872, entitled

Sunday not the Sabbath,” all that he quoted or 
summarized from Justin, Irenaeus, Clement, Ter- 
tullian, Victorinus, Origen, Eusebius, Jerome, 
Luther, Melancthon, Milton, Heylin, Baxter, Pa­
ley and Neander. -

The quotations and summarized statements, 
which cost me weeks of, laborious research, were 
appropriated', together with other matter, by the 
literary thief, and palmed off as his own. And 
yet I should not have noticed the plagiarisffi, but 
for his unprovoked disparagement and abuse of 
me as a writer. .

The tract will be ready, I hope, in two or three 
weeks, and I will send a copy gratis to every one 
who wants it. Address at once by card.

■• W. H. Bunk,
Washington, D. C.

[Mr. Burr must forgive us for not having re­
membered that it was the Rev. F. J. Briggs, and 
not himself, that had aroused the ire of the fran­
tic controversialist of Presidio, San Francisco, Cal. 
Our forgetfulness led Mr. Coleman into an awk­
ward fix, from which he has not yet extricated 
himself.—Ed.]

A Request to the “ Religlo-Philouophlcal Journal.”
Editor of Mind and Mailer :

" No argument like matter of fact.”
It is one of that kind of arguments we ask of 

iiw Journal. ,-
It claims to be a paper publishedjn the inter­

est of Spiritualism—which many disbelieve. It 
claims that it attacks and attempts to expose 
only fraudulent mediums and their frauds, which 
is generally disbelieved. It claims that it has 
been engaged in the work of purging Spiritual­
ism of its fraudulent mediums and defending and 
recommending the genuine ones, yvhile it has 
been vigorously engaged in the work of assailing 
mediums ever since S.S. Jones was assassinated. 
It claims to have been par excellence to the Spirit­
ualists, the “alarm bell” against fraud-practising 
mediums, and no. others; and it has kept its 
“ding-dong” incessantly going.

The above being its professed occupation and 
its mania, we make this request of that organ.

Will the Rcliyio-Philosonliical Journal give uh a 
list of the names of all the generally known 
American mediums, for any ofthe forms of physi­
cal manifestation, that it has not published charges 
against, or assailed directly in its editorials as 
fraudsand cheats; and this, too, without having 
recalled one of those accusations after the charges 
have been proven false and the integrity of the 
mediums fully vindicated, and without allowing 
any defense of those unjustly assailed mediums 
in its columns? ’

We repeat, will the Journal'please give us a list 
in full of all those mediums for physical manifes­
tations, since Mr, Jones’ death, that it has steadily 
endorsed and recommended, without detraction, 
as genuine and reliable mediums; -give us the full 
and complete list? The Spiritualists need it as a 
sort of directory ..to keep them from being 
imposed upon by false mediums and other 
Spiritualist papers’ recommendations of them. 
This the Journal owes to the Spiritualist public. 
In making out this list, let the Journal look well 
to its files, to see that it does not get in any of the 
names of mediums in good standing whom it has 
assailed and tried to destroy, either liy corres­
pondences, editorials, or both. Give us the full 
list of those it has never assailed, and always re­
commended, and no more. The list will not bo 
so long as to crowd its columns very severely, and 
it will show us where the Journal stands, or father 
sits, and what it sits on, and how many reliable 
mediums for physical manifestations it 'would al­
low U8, if it could have its own way.

Capt. S., of 1’., Ill, in anti-slavery and pro­
slavery times, used to be frequently boasting 
that he was a friend to the negro, especially 
after lie had been misusing one in public; but no 
one ever saw him befriend or assist a negro. So 
the R.-P. Journal claims that it is the friend of 
mediums, but how many physical mediums has it 
been caught befriending and assisting? Will it 
please publish the list for us? I have no author­
ity to say or suggest it, but I presume the Spirit­
ualist papers would ropublish the curiosity. This 
is only putting the Journal under “ test condi­
tions,”, to see liow many of its pretentions of 
friendship for mediums are genuine manifesta­
tions, whilst its omission of other good mediums 
its has assailed will be no more disparagement to 
them than it will be to Harry Bastian.

Let us have the list.
F. J. Briggs.

707 West Jefferson street, Bloomington Illinois, 
August 24th, 1881.

----------------^*. >----------------

Mind and Matter Free-List Fund. ‘
This fund was started by the request of many ol 

our subscribers, that many deserving poor people 
who were not able to pay for Mind and Matper, 
might have the paper sent to them free of cost. 
The following contributions have been made since 
our last report:

Previously acknowledged, $109 08
H. Bickford, Livingston, Wis., 70
P. F. Stern, 60
Thos. Atkinson, Oxford,' Ind., 4 00
Jas. Kinsey, Cincinnati, Ohio, 2 00

$117 28

Report of Lawrence Meeting. -
The Annual Meeting of the Spiritualists and 

Liberalists of Van Buren and adjoining counties 
was held in a grove, on the. Fair Grounds, near 
the village of Lawrence, Michigan, commencing 
on Saturday, August 6ih, 1881, at three o’clock 
P. M., with L. 8. Burdick in the chair.—devoting; 
the session to short speeches and conference. _

Sunday morning tne genial face of our Presi­
dent, L. 8. Burdick, was visible in the chair, and 
all nature was radiant with smiles, while a Free 
Methodist Camp Meeting in session two or three 
miles distant, was the centre of attraction for 
superficial minds, leaving us with a comparatively 
small audience of solid thinking men and women, 
whose wrapt attention gave evidence that they 
were interested in our beautiful philosophy of 
life. .

The morning session was occupied by A. B.; 
French, of Clyde. Ohio, in a short speech, fol­
lowed by Mrs. M. C. Gale, of North Lansing, 
in a speech of one hour; her Voice also- 
rang out in sweet tones ef soul inspiring music, 
making the grand old woods'echo with her songs. ' 
At the close of the morning session, the following 
named persons were elected as officers for the 
ensuing year, to wit: y

President, L. 8. Burdick, Kalamazoo; Vice 
President, Mrs. R. A. Sheffer, South Haven! Sec­
retary, W. J. Dennis, Breedsville; Treasurer, Miss 
L. B. Bangs, Paw Paw.

An intermission was then taken for dinner and 
social greetings until two o’clock, when Mrs. Gale 
gave an address of half an hour, on the “ Law of 
Compensation.” after which A. B. French gave 
the concluding address, contrasting the God of 
theology with that of science and liberalism.

The most perfect harmony prevailed, and each 
seemed to vie with the other, in contributing to 
the “ feast of reason and flow of soul ” that per­
vaded the atmosphere, filling the hearts of all' 
with good cheer. ' : ■

The next meeting is to be at South Haven, the 
first Saturday and Sunday of November 1881.

E. L. Warren, Secretary,
Paw Paw, Michigan.

Mrs. Patterson the Writing Medium. '
Ofir good friend, Mr. John Regan, of this city, 

has shown us some remarkable messages received 
by him through the mediumship pf the above 
named lady, now located at No. 421 Hartman 
street, Camden, N. J. Some of them by indepen­
dent writing upon a double slate, and some upon 
paper under control by her own hands. Of the 
former are one from “ R. Dale Own," one from 
Mr. Regan’s daughter, S. E. Regan, and two from 
“ Billy ” (Jones). Of the latter are two from the 
same daughter (S. E. R.), one from R.’ Dale-Owen, 
two from E. V. Wilson, one from J. K.Morange, 
one from Lucretia Mott, one from J. Haines, one 
from Dr. Webb, one from A. Avery, and 
one from “ Billy.” Those upon the slate appear to 
be all in one hand writing; those written by the 
hand of the medium are remarkably different in 
style of chirography, each one retaining its dis­
tinctively marked character throughout. We 
have not space to reproduce these messages, which 
although quite interesting; are not of a' novel 
nature, but, in our opinion, they bear evidence of 
genuine niediumistic power on the part of Mrs, 
Patterson. Go and see her.

Mediums' Home Fund.
We, the undersigned, subscribe or pledge the 

amounts Bet opposite our respective names, to 
found a national home to give relief and suste­
nance to worthy, needy mediums in the United 
States. ■

CASH. .

Ain’t prev'ioiiHl.v ucknowlegcii in Mind and Matter 8122 40
John H. McElroy, Pillnburg, Pn.................................. 50
Jacob Kuhn, York, Pa.................................................. 50
Chrintophcr Lug, PitlHburg, Pa.................................... 1 (JO
Mm. 1'hcbc A. Hume*, Altoona, Pa............................. LOO
R, I1’, HimIcH, .Spruce Creek, Pa..................... .;.......... 1 00
twine Jhelt, " .................................. 50
Mr. and Mm. F. J. Ambrosia, Philadelphia Pa.,.........  1 00-
John P. Lanning, Philadelphia, Pa.................. ........... 1 00
George Belzer, ’’ ...................... ’....... 50-
Chinlea Bingham, “ ,:........................... 50
H. A. Mom6, "     1 00
H. Schock, "   1 0O
James Marlow, “   1 0O
B. C. H. Kuiner, Vinehind, N. J................................... 1 00
Ciirrlfe Miller, Brooklyn, N. Y...........T. J...................... 50
Mm. S. B. CuBHey, " ........................1............ 1 00
J. Roworth, " ..................................... 5 00
Mm. M. A. Newton, New York City,.......................... 1 00
Mm. II. J, Newton, ”   1 00
Mm. Mary B. BillhigB, "   1 00
Ellie FoHter, per Mm. Crindle, N. Y. City.................. 50
A Friend, N. Y. City..................................................... 1 00
Mm. II. C Shepard, N. Y. City.................................... 1 OO
Margaret Loth, Brooklyn, N. Y................................... 50
Mm. H. W. IL, •’ ........................................... 5 00
Mm. Elisha Young, Champaign, 111,............................ 50
W. II, Bent, Dayton, Ohio............................................. 1 00
Job. Cauldwell, Southington, Ct., per Bunner of Light 1 00
Spirit I,otela, perpMIwShelhuiner, —...................... 1 00
Mm. McIntyre,'I’enHiieola, Fla..................................... 1 00
R. GcHHler, Bnnle, Switzerland..................................... 3 00
Contributions of 10c. each (2)....................................... 80

" Me. “ (8).................................................. 2 40
•' 20e, " (10)...................................... 2 00
“ 10c. ” (51...................................... 5 10

Total Paid.......................................... 8109 20

PLEDGED.

Pleitgen previoiiHly acknowledged in Mind and 
Matter....... ......................................     8258 00

Samuel Graham, Kingsbury. Ind................................. 1 00
Mr. and Mm. Geo. Dodson, Terre Haute, Ind............ 2 00
J. D. RobbhiB, Terre Haute, Ind.................................. 50
Mm. Corbit. Malvern, Ark........................................... 1 00
Mm. Dr. J. Bull, Little Rock, Ark............................... 1 00
J. V. Pedron, Camden, Ark.......................................  5 00

Total Pledged........... . ......................  8268 50

Mr. Geo. Rall, Treasurer of the Mediums Home 
Organization, will receive and acknowledge your 
contributions. Address, No. 482 West Liberty 
Street, Cincinnati, Ohio.

Alfred James
Is prepared to answer calls to lecture under spirit 
control, on ’subjects choqen by the audience or an­
swer questions, or spirits will choose their own 
subjects at the option of the society, at any point 
within one hundred miles of Philadelphia. For 
full particulars and terms address, -

. A. James,
No. 1119 Watkins St., Philada., Pa.

Wm. Butterfield, Silverdale, Kansas, writes: 
“ Finding much to admire, and very little to ad­
versely critcise in Mind and Matter, I say go on 
in the good work you seem so well qualified to 
perform, and may all friends of truth and progress 
rally to your assistance in supporting a paper that 
advocates Spiritualism without ifs or ands.”

1
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HEALING MEDIUMS. SPIRITUAL MEDIUMS.60
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15
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FOR SALE BY

Philosophy ot Creation by Spirit, by T. Paine.........
" " " “ paper..

Rules and Advice for Circles, by J. H. Young......... 
Spirit Invocation, or Prayers and Praise, by Mrs. 

Conant....,. ;..'„„;......... ........ .................................
Startling Facts in Spiritualism, by N. B. Wolfe.......

1 25
2 00

“MIND AND MATTER" PUBLISHING HOUSE,
713 Sansom Strbet, Philadelphia.

All orders, with the price of Books desired, and 
the additional amount mentioned for postage, will 
meet with prompt attention. In making remit­
tances, buy postal Orders if it is possible, if not, send 
■money in registered letter. Fractional parts of a 
■dollar may be sent in postage stamps.

WORKS OF ROBERT DALE OWEN.
Debatable Land between this World and the

Next. Proof Palpable of Immortality..............  
Beyond the Breakers. A Spiritual Story.... ............ 
Footfalls on tlie Boundary of Another World..........

WORKS OF DR. J. M. PEEBLES.
Seers of the Ages or Spiritual Guide......... ...............  
Travels Around the World, or What I Saw............. 
Spiritual Harp, 2.00. Postage 14. Full gilt............. 
Buddhism and Christianity Face to Face...............  
■Christ, tlie Corner Stone of Spiritualism........ ..........  
Spiritualism Defined and Defended......................... 
Jesus. Myth, Man, or God?.......................................  
Witch Poison und tiio Antidote..............................  
Spiritual Harmonies paper 20 cents boards 25 cents 

cloth 35 cents, postage 8 cents.
Darwiriism vs. Spiritualism.......................................

WORKS OF M. B. CRAVEN.
■Criticism on tlie Theological Idea of Deity..............  
Triumph of Criticism. On the Bible.......................  
Christianity Before the Time of Christ..................... 
Fabulous Tendency of Ancient Authors..................  
Biblical Chronology.................................................. 
Review of the Deluge............................................... 
Where Was Jesus Baptised?....................................  
Origin ofthe Trinity.................................................. 
Philosophy of Immortality.......................................

WORKS OF HENRY C. WRIQHT.
The Living Present and Dead Past, or God Made 

Manifest and Useful. Cloth 75, post 5, paper.....
A Kiss for a Blow, small edition............................  
Errors of tlie Bible, paper 35, postage 3, cloth..........

WORKS OF ALLEN PUTNAM.
Bible Marvel Workers..............;..............................  
Agassiz and Spiritualism........................................... 
Natty, a Spirit. His Portrait and His Life..............  
Tipping His Tables.................................................... 
Mesmerism, Spiritualism. Witchcraft Miracle..........

WORKS OF PROF. WM. DENTON.
■Geology; The Past and Future of our Planet..........  
Soul of Things, Vol. I................................................

“ " “ , Vols. IT and HI..................................
“ " “ Single Volume...................................

What Was He? or Jesus in the Light of the Nine­
teenth Century....................................................

The Deluge in the Light of Modern Science............  
Radical Rhymes. A Book of Poems.......................  
Is Spiritualism True?................................................  
Radical Discourses on Religious Subjects........ ....... 
■Orthodoxy False, since Spiritualism is True...........  
What ft Right?..................................... ....................
Be Thyself. A Discourse on Selfhood.................... 
■Common Sense Thoughts on the Bible....................  
■Christianity no Finality............ ...................... .........
Man's True Saviours............................... .................
Who arc Christians?..a.......................................... ...

$2 00
1 50
1 75

2 00 
'2 00
3 00

25
10
15
75
35

20

1 50
25
25

' WORKS OF HUDSON TUTTLE.
■Origin nnd Anticqiiity of Physical Man....................  
Arcana of Nature or Laws ot Creation....................

“ “ “ or the Philosophy of Spiritual Ex-.
iHtciiee,................ .................. ..................................

Arcanii of Spiritualism................ ...............................
The Ethics of Spiritualism, cloth..............................

“ " “ paper.........................
Tlie God Idea in History..........................................
Tho Christ Idea in History.......................................

"WORKS OF THOS R. HAZARD.
Ordeal of Lifo.....................'........................................
Blasphemy, "Who ure thoBlasphemers?" ..  
Eleven Days nt Moravia............................................ 
Mediums mid Mediumship............ ..........................  
■Civil and Religious Persecution In Now York State 
Examination of tlie Bliss Imbroglio......................... 
Spiritual Communion Tracts, No. 1............... ..........
Essays; Moral, Spiritmil and Divine, No. 2...,..........

•• ....................... . " 3, 5,6..........
WORKS OF MRS. M. KING.

Principles of Nature....... *............. . ..........................  
jlenl Life in Spirit Land.......................................... .
Tiio Brotherhood of Mini...........................................  
Social Evils; Tlieir Causes and Cure....;..................  
The Spiritual Philosophy vs. Diabolism..................  
What is Spiritualism?......................... .....................
■God, tho Father, ami Mini the Imago of God...........

WORKS OF A. .1. DAVIS.
Nature's Divine Revelations.................................... 
■Great Harmonic.........................................................
Magic Stuff.................................................................
Aralmla, or The Divine Guest.................................. 
Approaching Crisis of Truth vs. Theology..............  
A Stellar Key to the Mummer hind, paper cover.... 
Views of Our Heavenly Home, paper......................  
Philosophy of Special Providence, cloth.................

paper....
Answers to Ever-Recurring Questions....
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1Morning Lectures.;........................................   I

Death and the After-Life, cloth.................................
“ . ................ " paper........... ...................

Harbinger of Health............................ .....................
Children's Progressive Lyceum................................ 
Diakka anil their Earthly Victims, cloth 50, pnper... 
History and Philosophy of Evil, cloth.....................

“ “• " “ •“ paper......... ........ ..
Harmonlal Man, cloth 75, postage 5; paper.............  
Memoranda of Persons, Places und Events............  
Free Thoughts Concerning Religion, cloth;.............

“ “ “ " paper............
Penetralia; Containing HarmonhilAnswers........... 
Philosophy of Spiritual Intercourse.......................... 
Inner Life; or Bpfrit Mysteries Explained..............  
Tlie Temple; On Discuses of the Brain and Nerves, 

paper, frontispiece omitted, clotli $1.50^.paper 
Tho Fountain, Willi Jets and New MeaimSts..........  
Tele of a Physician, cloth......... '................J.............

" " paper........................ /..............
Sacred Gospels of Arabllhi, full gilt.......... ,\............

'* 1 '" ornamental cover....... ......
■Genesis and Elides of Conjugal I«ove, cloth............

“ " " “ '.' “ paper............
Price of Complete Works of A. J. Davis, bound in

cloth

50
50
75
50

12 
io 
03 
03 
03 
02 
02

Spirit People, by W. H. Harrison..................... .......
Spiritual Pilgrim, by J. C. Barrett............................. 
Six Lectures and Poems, by Oora L. V. Richmond.. 
Spiritual Manifestations, by Charles Beecher..........  
The Only Hope or Time Reveals All, by Wright..... 
Theological Works of'T. Paine................................
The Spirit's Book....... . ............................................... 
Tlie World's 16 Crucified Saviours, by K. Graves.... 
The Fundimental Principles of Science....................
Tlie Two Ways of Salvation, by Clark................ . 
The World's Sages, Infidels and Thinkers...............  
Tlieodore Parker in Spirit Life...............................
The Bible, is it of Divine Origin? cloth.,..................

" “ “ paper....................
The Spirit World, bv J. Edmonds..................  ;
“The Gods" and other Lectures, by Ingersoll........  
Tracts on Spiritualism, by J. Edmonds.............. .
Truth Seeker Collection of Forms, Hymns, Recita­

tions, Forms of Marriage, Funerals, and other 
mutters................................ ,...............................

Voices—A Poem in four parts, by Barlow................
Visions of the Beyond................................................
Vital Magnetic Cure, bv Dr. Evans.... ......................
Voices from tho Spirit World, by Isaac Post............ 
What is Spiritualism? by Thomas G. Foster...........  
Aprocryplial New Testament............... ...................
Age of Reason, by Thomas Paine.............................  
Analysis of Religious Belief. Vis. Amberley.........  
Bible in India’, Hindoo origin of Hebrew and Chris­

tian Revelation..................;.................................
Babbitt's Chart of Health............... .hi.....................
Common Sense, by Thomas Paine.......................... ..
Common Sense Tlieology, by Hamilton..................  
Eating for Strength, by Dr. Holbrook................... ....
Gathering Crumbs, by a Medium..............................
Hedged In, by Mrs. Phelps.......................................
Heathens of tho Heath, A Romance.............. .
History of all Christian Sects nnd Denominations, 

by John Evens, L. L. D........ .............................
Intuition, A Beam of Liglit, by Mrs, Kingman.......
Is There a Devil ?............ ........................ ...................
The Koran, or Alcoran of Mahommed.....................  
Liver Complaint, Mental Dyspepsia and Headache, 

by Dr, Holbrook... ...........    ........
Life of Thomas Paine.......... ...... .a..........;,...............
Little Angel, a Storyj for Children.......... ................. .
Life and its Forces, Health and Diseases Correctly

Defined.' by Dr. Porter...........................................
Manual of Self-Healing by Nutrition............. ......... 
Man's Rigilts; or, How Would You Like It........ . 
Parturition Without Pain..;........... .........................
Statuvolence; or, Artificial Somnambulism............. 
Tlie Nerves and the Nervous, by Dr. Hollick..........  
Tho Bhiigavad Gita.................................. ......
The Battle for Broad..................................................
Volney’s New Researches in Ancient History....;..., 

“ Ruins...... ................................... ....... ..
New Gospel of Health, by A. Stone, M, D., cloth,...

Nature's Laws of Human Lifo.
pnper.
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Anima! Magnetism, by Gregory........ ...................... 
An Eye Opener, by Zepa, clotli.... .......,..„„..,.........  
A Common Sense View of KingDevid....................  
An Hour with tiio Angels, by A. Brigham......,...,,,,, 

“ “ paper............... ;....... ......
All About Charles IL Foster........................... 
A Dcfeiicc of Modern Spiritualism.................  

. ArtMngic................. ..................................................
An Epitome of Spiritualism, cloth...........................  
Biography of Mrs. J. IL Conant  
Biography of Satan, by K. Graves........................  
Bible of Bibles, " ......................... ;.
Chapters from tho Bible of Ages, by G, B. Stebbins.. 
Clock Struck One, by Rev. 8. Wateoii......................

" “ Three, " .......'....... .......
Diakkaism, by A. Gardner.......................................  
Death in the Liglit of Hnrmoniiil Philosophy....... . 
Discourses Through Mrs. Corn Tappan...................  
Book on Mediums.............................. ;.....................
Early Booial Life, of Mun.;;........ ...............................
Experiences of Judge Edmonds in Suirit Life.........  
Flushes of Light from tlie Spirit Lund....................  
Future. Life, by Mrs. E. Hwccl.................................  
•Ghost Land, by Em. H. Brittan................................

" “ “ paper..................
Isis Udveiled, by H. P. Blavatsky.... .......................  
Identity of Primitive Christianity and Modern Spir- 

ituilism, 2 vols...................................................
Life Beyond the Grave................ ...................... .......

‘ Ministry of Angels Realized," A. E. Newton.... . 
Mental Cure, by Rev. W. II. Evans  

Mental Medicine, “ ....................... .
Modern American Spiritualism, clotli................. —.

[Abridged edition except engravings]................  
.Mystery of Edwin Drood................................ .'........

Mini and His Relations, by Prof, Brittain................  
NIghtSide of Nature, or Gliosis and Ghost Seers, by 

C. Crowe......................................... ....................
Old Theology Turned Tp Side Down, Dr. Taylor..., 
On Miracles nnd Modern Spiritualism, by Alfred R.

Wallace, F. R. G. S....................................... ;.........
Occultism, Spiritism. Materialism, demonstrated by 

» Almira Kidd...... .....................................................  
Personal Experiences of W. II, Muinler......  
Poems from tlie Inner Life, by Lizzie Doten. 
Poems of Progress......................................... 
Poems, The Life Beyond and Within, by Stebbins... 
Poems by the Medium, Aehsa Sprague........  
'Planchette, or The Despair of Science.......... 
Proof Palpable of Immortality.....................
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Vital Force, How Wasted and How Preserved....... 
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Thp Vestal........................................  h.....)...~.
Bjpgntphicn) Sketches of Our Best Speakers...........  
Jesus qf Nazareth, biography, by Paul.................... 
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WOULD YOU KNOW YOURSELF
. CONSULT WITH '

A. B. SEVERANCE,
THE WELL-KNOWN

PSVCHOMETRIST AND CLAIRVOYANT.
Come in person, or send by letter a lock of your hair, or 

hand-writing or n photograph; lie will give you a correct 
delineation of character, givi ng instructions for self-improve­
ment, by telling what faculties to cultivate nnd what to re­
strain, giving your present physical, mental and spiritual 
condition, giving past and future events, telling what kind 
of a medium you can develop into, if any. What business 
or profession you are best calculated for, to be successful in 
life. Advice and counsel in business matters, also, advice in 
reference to marriage; the adaptation of one to the other, 
and whether you arc in a proper condition for marriage; 
hints and advice to those that are in unhappy married rela­
tions, how to make their piitli of life smoother. Further, 
will give an examination of diseases, and correct dlagosis, 
with a written prescription and instructions for home treat­
ment; wliich, if tho patients follow, will improve their health 
aud condition every time, if it does not effect a curb.

DELINEATIONS.
HE AMO TREATS DISEASES MAGNETICALLY AND OTHERWISE

Terms:—Brief Delineation, $1.00, Full and Complete De­
lineation. $2.00. Diagnosis of Disease, $1.00. Diagnosis and 
Prescription, $3,00. Full and Complete Delineation with Di­
agnosis. and Prescription, $5.01 Address A. B. Severance, 
19 Grand Avenue, Milwaukee, Wis.

Mrs. J. Selfe will give E'ectrio treatment daily. Hours 
9 A. M. to 8 P. M. No. 65 Mulberry St., Newark, N. J.

MRS. M. J. GARDNER-RANKIN. M. D.,
324 North Fifth St.. Terre Haute, Ind. .

Clairvoyant and Magnetic Healer, will give test and de­
veloping circles, and answer by mail any person that wishes 
to have a clairvoyant examination of disease. For full 
diagnosis of disease, send lock of hair, with name, age, sex, 
and complexion, and enclose $2 00 and a three cent stamp. 
All letters promptly answered. Test or circles by appoint­
ment. Office hours from 9 to 12 n. m, and from 1 to 3 p. m. 
Medical control, Dr. Haines. Test and developing circles 
given at 324 North Fifth St., every Monday evening, until ' 
further notice, for the benefit of tlie Medium’s Home Fund. 
Admission 25 cents. ■

. MRS. M. K. BOOZER,
Medium for Medical Diagnosis and Psychometry, 415 Lyon 
street, Grand Rapids, Michigan. Mrs. Boozer cures all forms 
of Chronic diseases. Diagnosis made by look of hair or 
patient's hand-writing. Diagnosis, Sitting or Psychometri- . 
ration, $2. Examination and prescription, with medicine, $3. 
The cure of the habit of using tobacco a specialty—the appetite 
often changed by one treatment. Terms, $5 per treatment.

DR. DUMONT C. DAKE, >
Magnetio Physician. Office and residence, 147 Clinton St., 

Brooklyn, N. Y. Fifteen years experience In the exclusive 
sad successful treatment ef Chronic Diseases.

T. V. UIJLITSBIELD,
Test Medium, answers sealed letters at 61 West Forty- 

Second Street, New York. Terms, $3.00 and four 3-oent 
stamps. Register your letters,

MRS. S. FAUST,
LETTER MEDIUM.

Communications by letter for persons at a distance, terms 
$1 and two 3-ot. stamps. Address, No. 936 North Thirteenth 
street, Philadelphia, Pa.

CABINET PHOTOGRAPHS OF
TOlTJLTm^lT. Hx£. ROBERTS,

Editor and Publisher of Mind and Mailer.-
A perfect and lifo like Cabinet picture of Jonathan M. 

Roberta, from tho studio of tho widely known artists, Gilbert 
and Bacon, of Philadelphia, will bo sent to any address in 
tho United States and British Provinces, upon the receipt qf 
thirty cents. Address JAMES A. BLISS, Sole Agent, No. 
713 Sansom Street,'Philadelphia, Penne.

Yourselves by making money when a golden 
I IDT D oluinee Isofl'ered, thereby always keeping poverty 
Her from your door. Those who always take driven- 

logo of tho good chances for milking money that 
Illll are ofl'ered, generally become wealthy, while 

those who do not improve such chances remain 
in poverty. Wo want many mon, women, boys and girls to 
work for ns right in their own localities. Tho business will 
pay more than ton times ordinary wages. We furnish an 
expensive outfit mid nil that you need, free. No ono who 
engages fulls to make money very rapidly. You cun devote 
your whole time to the work, or only your spare momenta, 
Full information and id 1 is needed sent free. Address Stiwhoh 
& Co,, Portland, Maine.

WHAT IS THIS I .....

A new Scientific and Wonderful Discovery, com­
bining two great elements in nature,

Electricity and Medicated 
Absorption.

? DR. ABBIE E. CUTTER’S

Electro-Medicated Amulets 15
Suspended around tho neck, so as to cover the hollow in 

front, tho moisture and warmth of the body act upon tlie 
plate.' This generates a giilvano-electrio current, which 
causes tho electricity to How through medicated compounds, 
and tiio healing virtues pass Into and through the system, 
renovating and building up every flbro of tiio body; induces 
a free olroulntion of tiio blood, stimulates tiio nervous sys­
tem, and keeps all the organs in Ji healthy condition, thus 
positively preventing infection from all contagious diseases, 
as tiio poisonous germs are nil destroyed before they have 
time to germinate and develop into Small Pox, Scarlet 
Rover, Dfptherla, Croup, Measels, Mumps, Scrofula. Bron- 
ohith, Asthma, nnd Incipient Consumption, Catarrh, Can­
cers, Tumors, Boils, Ringworm, Tetter, Sult Rheum, and nil 
Skin Diseases, ’

Thom Amulets not only protect persons from taking these 
diseases, but tliey will positively cure if applied at an early 
stage, and will greatly relieve and modify tho severest 
forms of nil diseases at any stage of development.

Every person should protect themselves with one of those 
Amulets, its danger lurks In every breeze, ’

As they are made and ofl’ered to the publlo for tho purpose 
of good und preventing suffering, tlie price inis been placed 
within tlie means of nl).

Price 50 cents. Agents wanted, 
. Address, DR, ABBIEE. CUTTER, East Wareham, Muss.

Vitapathic Healing- Institute,
B08 First Street, Louisville, Kentucky.

Fertile cure of all classes of disease. For information ad­
dress with three 3ct stamps WM. ROSE, M, D.

MILS. WM. ROSE, V.D.
tf 598 First St., IxmUvlHe, Kentucky.

JAMES A. BLISS,
■ LETTER medium.

Communications by letter for persons nt a distance. Terms 
$100 and three 3-ot stamps. Office, 713 Sansom St., PhUa. Pa.

i^rasr^
Trance, Healing, RiMiness and Test Medinin, 

Spiritual sittings dally. Seances Tuesday and Friday 
evenings. Aiid a pleasant home for invalids mid others to 
board, and receive medical treatment, if desired, by Jas.
Jennings, M. D. For terms send two 8-ot. stamps. Address 
Vineland, Now Jersey, Box 733,

MRS. A. S. WINCHESTER.
Tranoe Medium. Jotters answered and examined. Do- 
veloping.olrolos held. Bliss' Magnetized paper and Plan- 
ohottos always on hand. 620 Mason Street, (r. 0. Box 1997) 
Ban Francisco, Cal. • ,.

Mrs. Stoddard Gray “"id son Dewitt 0. Hough, 
Will give daily sittings from 10 a. m., to answer written or 
mental question. They also answer scaled letters. Com­
munications given on clean paper by rubbing ashes of 
burned paper upon It. At tholr residence No. 824 West 52d 
Street, Now York City, Sittings $2,00. ,

POWER is given John M. Spear to delineate character, 
to describe aud proscribe for disease of body nnd mind. Per­
sons desiring such aid may send handwriting, stating nge 
and sox, enclosing stumped and addressed envelope, with 
one dollar. 2210 Mount Vernon SI., Philadelphia, Pa. [tf,

TRANSITION,^ SPIRIT PHOTOGRAPHS
■ BY T. R, EVANS. '

By sending me a Look of Hair or Photograph of yourself, 
I will send the results of throe Photographic sittings. En­
close $1 nnd three 3-cenl postage stamps. Address,

T. R. EVANS, 71 Fourth Avo„ Louisville, Ky.

SPECIAL NOTICES.

ROWELL <t HICKCOX,
' IPhone graphic Reporters,

VINELAND, N. J.,
Will furnish Spiritualist Societies with Full Reports of Lec­
tures, Conventions, etc., nl moderate charges. Immediate 
attention given orders by telegraph.

Tho AMERICAN SHORTHAND WRITER publishes an 
entire course on Phonography every year, in n series of 12 
lessons, and exercises of all subscribers corrected by mail 
free. Subscription, $1.50. Single number, 15c. ROWELL 
A HICKCOX, Publishers, Vineland, N. J.

TRANSIENT BOARD.
For SPIRITUALISTS at No. 11^8 Vine Street, Philadelphia 
Penna. $1.60 per day.

A Outflt'furnishcd free, with full instructions for con- 
Pin ducting the'most profitable, business (lint anyone 
' 1111 wn engage in. The business is so easy lo learn, and 

01,r instructions are so simple and plain, that any 
W ono can make great profits from tho very start. No 

1 one can full who is willing to work. Women are as 
successful os mon, Hoys and girls can earn lingo sums, 
Many have made nt the business over ono hundred dollars 
in nsingle week. Nothing like It over known before. All 
who engage uro surprised ul tlie ease and rapidity with 
wliich limy uro able to make money; You can engage in 
this business during your spare limo at grout profit. You 
do not have to invest capital hr~it. Wo take all the risk 
Those who need ready money, should write to us at onob. 
A fullrnlshed free, Address Truk A Co., Augusta, Maine.

BOOKS BOOKS

MRS. LIZZIE LENZBERG.
Successful Healing Medium. Relieves in most cases. 

Communications wliile entranced. Will visit patients. 
References given. Hours 9 to 5, or later by appointment, 
354 West 35th street,, N. Y. City.

MRS. A. M. GEORGE.
Business Clairvoyant and Test Medium, Rooms Noe. 14 and 
15 Shively's Block, 114 Massachusetts Ave., Indianapolis, Ind.

DR. H. P. FAIRFIELD.
The Clairvoyant Magnetic Medicinal Physician Mid Tranoe 
Speaking Medium, has permanently located in Worcester, 
Mass., where he will continue his profession—healing the 
sick nnd answering calls to lecture. Address, Dr. H. P. 
FAIRFIELD, Box 275, Worcester, Mass.

J. Wm.VanNamee.M.D.. Clairvoyant and Mag­
netic Physician. No. 8 Davis St., Boston,Mass. Examinations 
made from look of hair $1.00. Psyoometrioal reading 
of character $2.00. Magnetized remedies sent for all diseases. 
Will answer calls to lecture before Spiritual Societies. Liberal 
Leagues, Temperance Societies, and attend Conventions and 
FuneraU'within reasonable distance from home on moder­
ate terms _ ________

MRN. (I. M. MOKRINON, M. D.
Thia celebrated medium Is used by tlie invisible for the 

benefit of Immunity. They, through her, treat all dleeatee, 
and euro where tlie vital organs necessary to continue lifo 
are not destroyed. Mrs Morrison is an unconscious tranoe 
medium, clairvoyant and clairaudiont. From tlie beginning, 
hors Is marked as the most remarkable career of success, 
such ns has seldom, if ever, fallen to the lot of any person. 
Mrs. Morrison becoming entranced, tlie look of hair is sub­
milted to her control. The diagnosis is given through her 
lips by lier Medical Control, ana taken down by her Beore- 
tnry. The original manuscript is sent to the correspondent; 
When remedies are ordered, tiie case Ih submitted to her 
Medical Band, who prescribe remedies suited to the case. 
Her Hand use vegetable remedies principally (which they 
magnetize), combined witli scientific applications of the 
magnetic healing power. Thousands acknowledge Mra. 
Morrison's unparalleled success in giving diagnosis by look 
of hair, and thousands have been cured with magnetized 
remedies prescribed by her Medical Bund. Diagnosis by 
letter; Enclose lock of patient's hair and $1.00: give the 
mime, age and sox. Remedies sent by mull to all naris of 
tho United States and Canadas. Address Miu. 0. M, Mott- 
bison, M. D„ P. 0. Box2519 Boston, Mass.

DR. W. A. TOWNE.
MAGNETIC'PH VSICINA AND CLAIRVOYANT; 

Spiunoiklii, Mash.
will give examinations made by lock of hair and 
a diagnosis given. All should try the Magnetic 
Bilious Powders. They are good for the liver 
and blood. Cures constipation nnd Piles. Espe­
cially adapted to all cases of indigestion and dis­
eases arising therefrom. Price $1.00 per box. 
Magnetized paper $1.00. Examination by lock of 
hair sent in letter $1.00. Best of reference given 
nnd certificates fiirnished by responsible parties if 
desired. Will visit patients at a distance if re­
quested. Dr. W. A. Towne, olllce 431 Main St., 

.Springfield, Mass.

PHILADELPHIA MEDIUMS.
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AMERICAN HEALTH COLLEGE
-AND- -

Vitapathic Medical Institute,
Incorporated by the Slate of Ohio.

Fortenclring and qualifying the highest grade of Health 
Doctors and Ministers of Life,.for the, cure of nil diseases of 
body mid soul. Also ' - ' ^ <■’''’ \^

VITAPATHIC SANITARIUM,
In a Beautiful Locution in FAIRMOUNT,

For Treating, Boarding and Nursing all classes of Invalids, 
and for curing every variety of Physical imd Mental Dis­
eases, and all Chronic, Nervous and Female complaints. 
Here iii tills Health Institution, Is employed, with greatest 
force and highest skill, nil the vast vitalizing Powers of 
Nature, tlirougli Vitalized Medicines, Food, Wider, Air, 
Heat, Light Electricity, Magnetism, and highest, ever­
living Vital Spirit. ,

PROF, J, B. CAMPBELL, M. D„ V. D„
Founder, President, and Phynician-ln-Chlef,

Fairmount, Cincinnati, Ohio.
EXPENSES.—Tn the Sanitarium for Room, Board, Fire, 

Light, (and Nursing when needed), with full daily Vita- 
piilhlc Treatment, range from ft 15 to $25 a week, according 
to cases. Tlie charges here are very low, because tlie cures 
are made so quickly, and, furthermore, because diseases are 
cured licre that cannot be cured in any part of the world.

MAGNETIC AND VITAL TREATMENT.
Bend 25 cents to DR. ANDREW STONE, Troy, N. Y.. care 

Luno and Hygienic Institute, and obtain a large and highly 
illustrated book on the system of VUalltlng Oonttrutllis 
Treatment, ’

A COMPLETE CATALOGUE
. AND PRICE LIST OF ALL TRE

SPIRITUAL. AND LIBERAL BOOKS AND PAMPHLETS
." PUBLISHED IN THE IGNITED STATES, . ■

Is now ready. Solid your name and address on a postal 
card to JAMUN A. RL1NN, 7111 Nansoin Street, 
Philadelphia, Pa., and receive one free of cost,

• THE FAMILY HAND BOOKi
Or, Recipes and Facta for tlie Million.

(TUusinited.) A perfect mine of Information, Worth $10 a 
year to anyone, Just the book for you, Sent free during 
the next thirty days, afterwards 10 eta. a cony.

-Address, - J. IL’MOSELEY,
. 141 S. Eighth St., Brooklyn, N. Y.

I

Tlie great demand for the History r/ the true inwardness 
ofthe hostility to Spirit Mnterinjiziitio.is that have appeared 
in tlie columns of Minn and Matter, him Induced us to bind 
up ii large number of hack numbers, containing tho serial In 
PAPER COVERS, They will be sent to any address in 
the United States or Canada for 50 cents, postage* free. If 
Spiritualists want to convince tlieir sceptical friends of th# 
determined opposition to materialization of spirit forma, 
they should buy tliis serial to distribute free,- ' .

Address
Circulate the Documents.

MIND AND MATTER, 
713 Sansom Str, Philadelphia, Penna.

Henry CriiHilc, Independent Shite Writing Medium, 
gives dully siltings nt 226 South Eighth St., Phlllulelpnia, 
Mr. Crindle also answers Sealed Letters anil gives correct 
answers. Price $1.00 and 3 ct, postage stamp, "

Ligule Mingle, Test and Business Medium, 1415 How­
ard Street. Sittings dally.

Mew. N. C, Fnnat, 936 North Thirteenth street, Trance, 
Test and Business Medium. letters answered front a dis­
tance. Feu for letter# $1 unit two 3-ot. stamps,

Mrn. ,L A. Dempsey, 1321 South Sixth street, Tranoe 
Test Medium. Sittings dully.

Mra. George, Business and Test Medium, 680 North 
Eleventh Street, Philadelphia. Circles.—Tuesday and 
Friday Evenings.

Mra. Mnry A. Nnenenum, M. D., Clairvoyant and 
Magnetic Healer. Consultation free, 467 North Fourth St. 
Olllce hours from 10 A. M. tod 1'. M, ,

Mrs. II. D. Olinninnii, Medium for tlie sick in body 
and mind. No. 1208 Mt. Vernon Street. -

MRS. LOOMIN, Trance Test nnd Healing Medium. 
Diagnosis of disease or business rending from look of hair 
by mall. 53 cents each. Medicated Vapor Baths and Electro­
Magnetic treatment given. 1312 Mt. Vernon St., Phila., Pa.

Dr. Henry C. Gordon, Materializing and Shite Wri­
ting Medium, 691 North Thirteenth street, Philadelphia. 
Select Bounces every Monday and Friday evenings at 8 
o'clock. Private sittings daily for Slate Writing testa and 
communications.

Mrs. Tillie R. Reedier, Trance Test Medium, No.
2317 Madison Square. Sittings dully; Communications . 
given both In Gorman and English,

Mra. E. N. Powell, Business and Tent Medium, Sit­
tings dully from 9 a. m. to 9 p, m., al N, W. Cor. Eighth and . 
Wood Streets, .

Mrn. llolilnek, German Tranoe and Test Medium, 
Circles every Wednesday and Bunday evenings, Bitting* 
daily, 1311 North Front Street. .

Mr. ami Mrn. T. J. AmbrOHln, Blate Writing, Clair­
voyant, Trance and Test Mediums, 1223 North Third Street, 
Circle every Sunday, Wednesday, and Friday evenings, 
also every Tuesday at 2.30 p. m. Consultations dally from - 
8 a. in. to 6 p. m.

Dr. Roxilana T, Rex, Healing and Test Medium, 
• 446 York Avenue, Mondays, Tuesdays and Thursdays, 
Diseases of women a speciality, Consultation free. Consul- 
talion by loiter, enclose throe 8-ol stamps, 'Developing circle 
Tuesday evenings. ' ■

Mi*h, A. E. Delliuta, Clairvoyant examination, and 
magnetic-treatment. Olllce hounl4wn\9 a.m. to 12 m„ and 
1 p.m. to I p.m. No. 861 North Broad st.. Phila.

Alf red Junies, Trance, clairvoyant anil letter medium, 
Test circles Tuesday and Friday evenings, Sittings dally, 
No. 1119 Watkins street.

Mr*. Kiltie Ii. Kobinson, the well-known Tranoe- 
test medium, will give siltings daily to investigators, at 2128 
Brandywine street.

Mrs. Currie Crowley, Trance Test Medium, will give 
select siltings dully from fl A. M. lo 5 P. M., at No. 1015 8, 
Sixth Street.

Mrn. E. .1. Wiley, Magnetic Healer, 1128 Vine street, 
Cures by laying on of hands, Olllce hours, 9 a. m. to 12 tn. ’ 
and 2 to 5 p. m. .
^MnrKllret II. Tiiylor, Trance, Test and Business Me­
dium, 1211 Germantown Road. Private sittings daily.

Magnetic Trentmeiit.—Cancers removed s;>eedily 
and surely. All affections of (lie Nerves a speciality. 
Charges moderate. Consultation free. I. W, Taylor 1211 
Germantown Road.

1 _ Outfits sent free to those who wisli to engage in the
most pleasant and profitable business known. Every­
thing new. Capital not required. We will furnish 

11J yd" eve ything. $10 a day and upwards is easily 
made without staying away from home over night. 
No risk whatever. Many n&w workers wanted nt 

once. Slimy lire making fortunes at tiio business. Ladies 
make as much as men, and young boys and girls make great 
pay. No one who is willing to wojk fails to make more 
money every day than cun lie made in a week at any ordi­
nary employment. Those who engage at ones will find a 
short road to fortune. Address H. Hallett A Co., Port-

I land, Maine. '■

PHILADELPHIA SPIRITUAL MEETINGS.

A CONFERENCE ANO CIRCLE willl be hold every 
Sunday afternoon at 3 o’clock, at tlie Thompson St, Church, 
below Front. TTirnte db'rdiully invited.

RHODES' IIALL.-Spiritual Headquarters, 505'4 N. 
Eighth Street. A religious spiritual meeting mid circle at 
2}^ p. m., and circle at 7H p. m. . -,

PARTNER WANTED—In a fine bearingOrangeOrove ' 
and Winter Hotel. Ideality tiio most beautiful mid healthy 
on the Gulf Coast of Florida. Address, M. 0. DWIGHT, 
Orange Bluff Hotel and GulfiCoast Real Estate Agency, 
Clear Water Harbor, Florida.

r
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NESHAMINY.

AY ANNIE H. LANIN0.

From the happy land of apirita, 
Where our loved departed dwell, 

Lo 1 there came a host of angels, 
' Bringing tidings sweet to tell;

And they walked beside the plowman, 
Sharing in his daily toil, 

While they bjtessed his faithful labors, 
As he turned the mellow soil. 

«.
But the plowman's heart was lonely 

For those who once shared his home, 
And he felt himself a stranger, 

In a dreary world alone; . ‘
Then this angel host assembling, 

In a council grand to see, 
With a holy consecration, 

Blessed the grove Neshaminy.
* While they gathered round the seers, 

And the thinkers of the land 
Filling them with Inspiration 

; Which they scarce could understand;
Bringing from the silent shadows, 

Teachers whom the world ne’er knew, 
Giving them a grander mission, 

In a nobler work to do.

With earth’s children here assembled, 
Nature bright and peaceful round­

Angels breathed a benediction 
, Oh this consecrated ground.

And when showers from heaven had fallen, 
With their copiou b.essings free, 

Through the rifted clouds, the sunbeams 
Smiled, and kissed-Neshaminy. (

Her^ beneath this leafy shading, 
Where the plashing falls are heard, 

Earnest thinkers, met, and listened 
To the new inspiring word. 

And the heavy heprted plowptan 
Took the glorious tidihgs home, 

' ' Felt Himself no more, a si ranger,
In a dreary world alone. , 

. He had caught the inspiration .
Which was sent his life to cheer, 

Learned how, by the law of kindness, 
- He could draw his loved ones near; 

And the anthems that were echoed, 
, Through the grove, from tree to tr<Je, 

Still are ringing in the plashing 
Of the falls, Neshaminy.

• • •■ — -------- ।

A Just and Meritorious Defence—Pence Hall Medium, 
Annie M.* Stewart, Vindicated.

great injustice, and we, the said proprietors and 
publishers of the Gazelle, do hereby retract them 
entirely and absolutely.

“Terre haute, Ind., May 3Q, 1881.
. “ Wm. C. Ball,

“ Spencer F. Ball."
At her home,'in the city of Terre Haute, the 

medium is exhonorated by the above retraction 
and relieved of the odium which Hutchinson & 
Co., intended should crush her and leave the slan­
derer’s poisoned fangs to fasten upon the innocent 
and helpless children of the despised medium; 
Annie M. Stewart. ,

But our work is not done, nor will it be while 
one remains whom we can reach, whose mind 
through the scurrilous language found in the R.- 
P. Journal remains .poisoned and prejudiced 
against the world’s renowned medium, Annie M. 
Stewart.

Doubtless, for the double purpose of adding dis­
grace to the name of Annie M. Stewart, and 
swindling the duped, her villainous calumniators 
advertized in their organ (R.-P. J.) a notice that a 
book of about 100,12mo. pages, containing a full 
report of Jhe pending trial for libel of Stewart vs. 
Gazette, would be mailed to all subscribers within 
two days after the verdict is rendered, and that 
only as many copies will be printed as will suffice 
to fill orders received in advance, and those who 
fail to remit the dimes promptly, must ever re­
main ignorant of the horrible crimes committed 
by the ignoble medium, Annie M. Stewart.

To excite the public and induce the subscribers 
to send in th? dimes for the promised book, the 
publisher,'in his advertisement insinuates that 
the legal investigation at the trial will develop 
surprising disclosures by the sworn testimony of a 
most positive and startling character, not hereto­
fore published, revealing the miserable life of the 
wretched medium, Annie M. Stewart. Those pos­
sessed of narrow and diminutive minds, con­
demned on intimation of misdemeanor, based on 
no better evidence than the above, and consigned 
without stint, to prison walls, the innocent and 
inoffensive medium, Annie M. Stewart. , 

The subscribers for the above book, are told by 
the advertising mountebank, that the appendix 
will contain a full report of the alleged libelous 
charges against Mrs. Stewart and the committee, 
as originally published in the Gazelle, upon which 
the suit for libel is based. To reach the doomed 
medium, it was necessary to excite public indig­
nation against her committee, and the libelous 
publicationsL referred to were the means used and 
succeeded, we regret to say, in hoodwinking those 
of reputed, discerning power, to hastily pronounce 
and denounce the committee “ villains and blood­
suckers,” and speak wickedly and maliciously of 
the fraudulent practices of the persecuted medi­
um, Annie M. Stewart. •

The name of J. F. Joice is given as the receiver 
of money and orders for the wonderful (?) book 
which is to be embellished with a fine photo-en­
graved portrait of (the culprit medium) Annie M. 
Stewart. In closing our remarks on the book 
swindle, we have this to say: the publisher, Joice, 
to us is a myth, and Alf. S. Hutchinson is the in­
stigator, whose purpose, we understand, was to. 
swindle the public out of their money, stigmatize 
the committee, and add infamy to the name of 
Annie M. Stewart..

Those who don’t know of the despicable means 
used, and the vigorous efforts made by the guilty 
parlies, to blacken and destroy the, character and 
respectability of her, whose only offence is that 
of being by nature a medium, may think our crit­
icisms unnecessarily severe; but those who know 
as we do, of the heart-rending anguish they, by 

■ sneers, scoffs and slander caused the sensitive me­
dium to suffer, and the bitter burning tears to 
shed over her little innocent and defenceless chil­
dren, will admit that we have been too generous 
in our language with her enemies, in the defence 
of that noble woiflan and grand medium, Annie 
M. Stewart.

Let it be remembered by a generous and for­
bearing public, that Mrs. Stewart, to protect her­
self and little ones was forced to’command'by 
legal process her slandering foes to meet her be­
fore a judicial tribunal and answer to her com­
plaint'for libel; and that the defendants, who had 
public prejudiced favor them against mediums, 
and antagonize justice to her before the court, 
after several months of investigation, admitted 
their failure to find the proof, that would sustain 
them in the damnable charges published against 
the character of the abused and persecuted medi­
um, Annie M. Stewart.

As editor of the R.-P. Journal, yon, John C. 
Bundy, without cause or provocation, permitted 
your sheet to be used by her slandering enemies 
in the cowardly effort to destroy by falsehood and 
slander the merited fame of the honest and trust­
worthy medium, Annie M. Stewart. We further 
charge that you, Col. Bundy, aided to the extent 
of your ability, editorially and otherwise in the 
detestable efforts to destroy the reputation and 
usefulness of one whom you personally never 
have seen, of one that never harmed you byword, 
act or deed; 0jje whose character her defamers 
dare not attack under legal investigation, and one 
who in the galaxy of mediums is a bright and 
shining star. That one Col. Bundy is the slandered 
and abused medium, Annie M. Stewart.

In conclusion, we report to her many admiring 
friends, that Mrs. Stewart is in good health and with 
medial powers greatly increased in magnitude, 
particularly within the last six months, continues 
to bewilder, astonish and delight, daily at her 
seances, new investigators who never fail at the 
close, to join the numerous friends in giving praise 
to, and blessing the name of the honored and re­
spected medium, Annie M. Stewart.

And now, with the most implicit confidence, 
based on intimate acquaintance of over eight and 
a half years we, her committee, with great pleas­
ure recommend to the public, one whose character 
in all the relations of life'has proved-estimable par 
excellence. One, who by us, during our long 
acquaintance has never been detected, either in 
the social relations or in that of mediumship, in 
a dishonorable act. One whose powers as a me­
dium are unsurpassed. We make this record, 
knowing that mortals and angels will sustain us 
in our endorsement of the good life and excellent 
mediumship of Annie M. Stewart.

Thus do we close for the present our defence, 
with the name still lingering on our lips, of the 
noble, grand and trustworthy medium, Annie M. 
Stewart. ‘

4 Allen Pence,
■ James Hook,

Samuel Conner,
Committee.

Terre Haute, Ind., July 12, 1881.

Terre Haute, Ind., Aug. 22,1881.
Editor of Mind and Matter:

Inclosed I hand you the retraction and our ad­
dress, by which you will see that. Mrs. 8. was vic­
torious in her suit for libel. We fully realize that 
it was by the aid and assistance o'f Mind and 
Matter that we succeeded, durine the raid, in 
holding her as a shining light, and that you will 
be pleased to know of her success over the villain­
ous persecutions. We further realize that the vin­
dication of Mrs. Stewart is a triumph for all per­
secuted mediums, and for thiA additional reason 
we desire to give it a general circulation, and in 
behalf of the cause and the friends of the commit­
tee, solicit for it a place in you paper.-

Yours, Allen Pence,
i For the Committee.

To a Just and Generous Minded Public :
No medium of modern times more justly and 

deservedly merits public confidence and sympa­
thy, than does the Pence Hall Median, Annie M. 
Stewart. None has sufl'ered persecution and 
vituperation more unjustly and undeservedly 
than has the trustworthy medium, Annie M. 
Stewart.

From the beginning of her mediumistic devel­
opment at Pence Hall, January 1st, 1873, the low 
vulgar miscreant, and the gossipping news ven­
der? and tlie vilifying slanderer, have made it 
their unholy business to maliciously utter and 
promulgate fabricated falsehoods, to defame, and, 
if possible, destroy by slander, the good and un­
blemished name of Annie M. Stewart.

The prejudiced editors of the Terre Haute Even­
ing Gazelle years ago opened their columns to the 
enemies of Spiritualism, and were, from her ad­
vent at Pence Hall, the uncompromising enemy 
of Annie M. Stewart.

Under the protection of her committee, the per­
sistent and persevering Gazelle, aided and encour­
aged by a prejudiced public, was powerless to 
suppress the rapidly extending fame as a medium 
of Apnie M. Stewart. To aid in the nefarious 
work, the Gazette^ April, 1879, inaugurated Alf. 8. 
Hutchinson, a stranger and migrating wanderer, 
and curb-stone editor, to assist in suppressing the 

' invincible Annie M. Stewart.
The association and affiliation of the above 

street news-monger with gutter-snipes, had the 
publishers of the Gazelle, in less than five months, 
in the unwonted coils of a libel suit, at the in­
stance'of their victim, Annie M. Stewart. The 
unexpected suit, for libel closed his engagement 
with the Gazette, and the libeler Hutchinson was 
not afterward wanted, in Terre Haute, to assist in 
demolishing the medium, Annie M. Stewart.

To continue the dirty work against her and 
avoid public’indignation, the stool-pigeon editor, 
Alf. 8. Hutchinson, flew, by instinct, as it were,'to 
his affinity, John C. Bundy, to aid through the 
columns of his sheet, the R.-P. Journal, (Chicago), 
to destroy by falsehood and slander, the insup­
pressible medium, Annie M. Stewart.

Bitter hatred and intense prejudice innately en­
gendered by each, against mediums generally, 
made Hutchinson,at the Bundy editorial sanctum 

. a welcome guest; and in harmony the two 
worked assiduously and energetically to destroy 
by sneers and falsehoods the personal character 
of Annie M. Stewart. _ .

The undertaking to drive the medium disgraced 
and maligned into obscurity was a failure, and 
resulted adversely to the interest, financially, of 
the Journal; and the defunct Hutchinson retired 
to private life, leaving the besieged fort in the 
peaceable possession of the victorious medium, 

. Annie M. Stewart.
The defendants to the libel suit found on inves­

tigation—as we knew they would—the life and 
character of the plaintiff unstained, and compla­
cently asked the committee for terms on which 
they could compromise the suit with the basely 
accused medium, Annie M. Stewart.

The defendants, on a compromise of the libel 
suit, were required to pay a stipulated amount of 
money to the plaintiff; and make the amende 
honorable by acknowledging the following retrac­
tion, after which, the defendants paying cost of 

■ court, the suit was dismissed by order of the mag- 
■ nanimous medium, Annie M. Stewart:

“ The libel suit of Annie M. Stewart vs. W. C. 
Ball and Spencer F. Ball, proprietors and pub­
lishers of the Terre Haute Evening Gazette, pend­
ing in the Vigo County Circuit Court, has been 
settled. The Gazdte acknowledges that the arti­
cles publish^! heretofore by them, attacking the 

^oersonal character of Mrs. Stewart, have done her

Mrs. Crindle Vindicated.

Editor of Mind and Matter: .
A friend has sent me a copy of Mind and Mat­

ter for July 28th, with the article bn Bundyism 
in New York and Boston, marked. The first no­
tice of Mrs. Crindle’s seances sent to the Banner 
of Light by Dr. J. R. Buchanan, I can endorse in 
full, as I was at one of them, and I think that Dr." 
J.*R. Buchanan was at the same. I will describe 
the one I attended as briefly as possible^it was 
in Mrs. C. H. Decker’s parlors, a room about 16x25 
feet. Mrs. Decker has a curtain in four parts 
hung across the back end of the room, some 5 or 
6 feet from the wall, for her own convenience. 
The space behind the curtains when let down 
formed the cabinet when used for seances. There 
was nothing behind the curtains but one common 
chair and a tin trumpet about a yard long. At 
the seance at which I was present, there were 
fifteen persons seated in a circle: Mrs. Decker 
sitting by the curtain to my left, a gentleman by 
the curtain at my right, while I sat in front of the 
opening in the curtain farthest from Mrs. Decker. ’ 
After all was arranged, Mrs. Crindle took her seat 
on the chair behind the curtain. In a short time 
the curtain near Mrs. Decker was opened and a 
spirit form dressed in white looked out: then 
went to the centre opening and looked out: then 
went to the opening in front of me, walked out 
holding out both of her hands to me, I arose to 
meet her, she gave me her name—Katie, put her 
arms about my neck and embraced me with all 
the ardor that a child could manifest for a parent 
and sobbed and kissed me for joy. I of course 
embraced and kissed her most fervently. She 
was but eight months old when she passed into 
the spirit world and has been there now about 
thirty-four years. I asked her if Mary was there. 
She said no' but that Emily was and would come 
out to me. As the power waned, she stepped 
back to the curtain and we parted our hold of 
each other, she retired behind it, and I took my. 
seat.

In a few moments the curtain opened again, 
when another spirit form clothed in white came 
out and walked up to me, holding out both hands, 
and as I arose to meet her, gave me her name, 
Emily, which was that of my wife who has been 
in the spirit world eleven years. She stayed out 
some minutes, then retired. A spirit came out, 
beckoned to a lady, who went up to her. They 
embraced and talked of family matters, and of 
members of it who were out Qf town; so that she 
was perfectly satisfied of the spirit’s identity. An 
old man came to the center opening, called up a 
lady, who recognized the spirit as that of her hus­
band’s father. Another spirit came out and 
walked around the room, and retired behind the 
curtain nearest me. She was dressed in full stage 
costume, with all her jewels sparkling upon her. 
She has been an actress. -

An East Indian came to the center opening and 
stood some minutes; he was a fine lookingpcr- 
son, with dark hair and complexion, moustache, 
etc. Five spirits showed themselves at the same 
time at the several openings. The controlling 
spirit talked with the audience while the manifes­
tations were taking place; also talked and sang 
through the trumpet loud enough to be heard a 
full block. I had never seen or spoken with Mrs. 
Crindle before that evening, and not then until 
after the seance was over, when I was introduced 
to her, and I know of no way by which she could 
get the names of my wife and child. This is not 
all that took place, but it is the part that I recollect 
most distinctly.

■ Yours for truth and justice, '
J. F. Howland.

116 E. J26th street, X. Y. City.

New Publications.
The Dictionary of Education and Instruction: A 

reference- book and manual on the theory and 
practice of teaching, for the use of parents, teach­
ers and others; based upon the 1 Cyclopedia of 
^education.’ By Henry Kiddle and A. J. Schem.

The preface of this work, names the special­
objects designed to be obtained by its publication 
as; 1. To supply 'a brief compendium of tlie 
theory and practice of education, in a-'series of 
clear and definite articles, alphabetically arranged 
so as to be easily referred to or'systematically 
studied. '2. To encourage in this way the study 
by teachers of the principles and practice of their 
profession, thus giving to the work of education a 
greater degree of intelligence and efficiency. 3. 
To afford a convenient class manual of pedagogy 
for use in Normal schools and teachers institutes, 
as the basis of a course of instruction in principles 
and methods, not necessarily superseding other 
valuable manuals differently arranged, but accom­
panying and strengthening them. 4. To supply 
at a small cost to every teacher, that portion of 
the ‘ Cyclopiedia ’ which is of especial value in 
practical education, reserving this larger work for 
occasional reference, particularly when informa­
tion regarding educational history, biography, 
and statistics is needed: and 5. To supply a use­
ful hand-book to parents in the home education 
of their children.

The articles contained in this work have se­
cured the highest encomiums for their philosoph­
ical correctness, practical character and literary 
excellence, the writers being all practical educa­
tors of long experience and distinction in their 
profession. -­

A valuable list of educational works for profes­
sional, study and reference; prepared by W. H. 
Payne, M. A., Professor of the Science and Art of 
Teaching in the University of Michigan, is added. 
298 Pages, price $1.50. E. Steiger & Co., 25 Park 
Place, New York.

The Elocutionist. We have received the July 
and August numbers of The Elocutionist, & sixteen- 
page journal, published monthly by the Young 
Folks’ Rural Publishing Company, at 116 Monroe 
street, Chicago. It is devoted to the science and 
art of Elocution, and choice selections for public 
and private readings, with full elocutionary advice 
for the proper delivery of the same. The editor, 
Prof. H. M. Dickson, is one of the most popular 
and successful teachers of elocution and dramatic 
art, in Chicago, and his articles on voice culture 
will alone be worth more each month than .the 
price of subscription. Here is a chance for all to 
obtain, at a nominal price, instruction in this 
beautiful and useful art. The Elocutionist will be 
sent to any address for 60 cents a year, or a speci­
men number for 10 cents. Address Young Folks’ 
Rural Publishing Company, 116 Monroe street, 
Chicago.

r A Seance With Mr. 1 F. Ackerly.
Philadelphia, Pa., August 28th. 1881, ; ' 

Friend Roberts:—Mr. A.F. Ackerly or Brook-' 
lyn, N. Y., has been in Philadelphia nearly two 
months giving seances at Various houses, but 
principally, at 1128 Vine street. During this time 
there nas been no mention made of him in your 
paper, (with two exceptions I believe.), I know 
that you have not flighted him intentionally, for 
I know your nature too well. The manifestations 
through Mr. Ackerly are certainly grand and 
mysterious, and I believe he is the youngest ma­
terializing medium in the field.

I can say in truth, that if there ever was a spirit 
medium on the face of this earth, Mr. Ackerly is 
one, and may success crown his efforts to extend 
the truth, and may mankind, through his agency, 
be led to aspire to the knowledge of life beyond 
the grave.

I have attended many of Mr. Ackerly’s seances, 
and have noticed that in his circles for physical 
rhanifestations in the light, the band working 
through him are quiet and orderly—once in a 
while, however, a boisterous spirit gets in and 
raises a noise.

Our old friend George Christy, (minstrel) who 
left earth some twenty-three years ago is Mr. • 
Ackerly’s control, and is as full of fun and music 
as ever. .

Mr. Ackerly’s light seances, as they are termed, 
are manifestations of spirit power behind and 
above a curtain suspended four feet from the floor 
across the corner of a room. Behind this curtain 
is a table, whereon are placed guitar, tambourine, 
zither, telegraph instrument, bells, and a pair of 
bone clappers. Mr. Ackerly and two others sit 
outside of this .curtain, holding each others hands. 
They are then covered with a blanket to exclude 
the light. Generally a song is sung, (but this is 
not always necessary.) Then taps, at first faint, 
but gradually becoming louder, announce the 
spirits arrival. Then others are telegraphed for, 
and presently a whole troupe are there, playing 
on all the instruments which are held high above 
the curtain in the open light-. Mary Queen of 
Scotts sounds the different chimes, on the zither, 
that were tolled at her execation. Hands and 
arms are shown, and a hand reaches forth, takes 
a pencil and paper, and writes messages to each 
one present, signing their names.

I have attended his seances for full forms, and 
have seen as many as seven figures, mostly fe­
males, come out of the cabinet separately. Mr. 
Aekerlv is a room-mate of mine, and I ha<ie had 
every chance to see if there was any deception 
practiced. I will expose fraud if I detect it. I ' 
must say that he is a genuine medium, or there 
is no such thing as spirit return, and I know there 
is. I do hope that all true investigators, sceptics, 
infidels, atheists, materialists, and all others who 
desire to know the truth, will come and see for 
themselves and rely on their own senses.

Ever for the truth;
Emanuel M. Jones.

[We know Mr. Jones to be a strictly honest, 
truthful and very intelligent man, and that what 
he has written is strictly true. We have not had 
the opportunity of witnessing the manifestations 
that occur at Mr. Ackerly’s seances, but will do so 
at the first opportunity.—Ed.] •

. E. V. Wilson Fund—Subscription for Bonds. '
We invite the attention of the many friends of 

the late E. V. Wilson to the following proposition, 
and trust they will cordially and promptly act 
upon it. It is a perfectly safe transaction and will 
enable Mrs. Wilson to save the homestead where 
rest the mortal remains of her parents and other 
friends. A good start has already been made in 
obtaining pledges to join in the loan, and all 
that is needed is a little effort to raise the 
whole amount. Mrs. Wilson is advised by 
competent real estate brokers and her law­
yers that enough of the property can be sold 
within two years to pay off the loan, and save the< 
homestead to her and her permanently invalid 
son. The prompt payment of the interest will 
be guaranteed by the trustee. Friends do not. 
hold back.

“ IK/ieraiaJhe estate of the late E. V. Wilson is in 
debt, and the farm of 240 acres and homestead 
ofthe family are under mortgages that must soon 
be paid; and, for the purpose of raising a fund to 
relieve the family and save the estate, it has been 
determined to create a loan, by issuing one hun­
dred and sixty bonds, of one hundred dollars 
each, drawing interest at four per cent, per an­
num, and secured by a mortgage or trust deed on 
the said homestead and farm, to be executed to a 
trustee for the benefit of the bondholders, the 
principle of said bonds to be due on or before ten 
years from date; and whereas, said premises are 
of value sufficient to secure said bonds, and the 
completion of the proposed loan will enable the 
family to gradually extinguish the debt by selling 
a portion of said premises in parcels: Therefore, 
we do hereby agree to take, and do subscribe for 
the number of such bonds we have below set op­
posite our individual names, to be delivered to 
and paid for by us, at $100 each, when all of such 
bonds shall "have been subscribed for as afore­
said." ______

-----------------<.<^4-----------------

An Appeal.
Owing to long continued ill-health I have been 

unable to resume my mediumship for over a year. 
Our home, the-savings of many years, is now about 
to be sold to satisfy claims to the amount of about 
$500. Will the friends contribute their mite 
toward a fund to relieve us from the impending 
calamity of losing our homestead? Reluctantly 
we niake known our distress through dire neces­
sity, knowing not where or to whom to look for 
assistance except to those in whose behalf we 
have labored faithfully for many years. This pe­
tition is made as the last resort, having exhausted 
every effort to relieve ourselves rather than pub­
licly ask aid. Respectfully,

J. Nelson Holmes, 
. Jennie W. Holmes.

We take from the Banner of Light the appeal of 
Mr. and Mrs. J. Nelson Holmes for assistance in 
their pressing distress, and we trust it will not be 
vain. Mr. Holmes’s health, as we know, has been 
such for a long time as to preclude his pursuing 
his mission as a medium; and thus he has been 
compelled to incur liabilities that are now har- 
rassing him.- Those who know what these vet­
eran mediums have endured, in the service of 
the spirit world, should not refuse them such as­
sistance as is in their power, and that without 
delay. Their address is Vineland, N. J., to which, 
place remittances should be made directly. .


